
DUE DATE:10/29/2025 DEPT: Public Safety
Company Name:  ►

Location:  ► Sandy Hook, CT Woodstock, GA Tuscaloosa, AL Decatur, AL
Description:  ▼

GROUP A: BUNKER GEAR (ALL SIZES)
COAT 2,650.00$                       2,080.00$                       NON-RESPONSIVE* 2,567.44$                         

Manufacturer/Model  Morning Pride Tails Coat  Globe DK245M  Lion Vforce 
PANTS 1,820.00$                       1,714.00$                       NON-RESPONSIVE* 1,666.36$                         

Manufacturer/Model
 Morning Pride Pro Fit 

Pant 
 Globe FK245M  Lion Vforce 

HOODS 123.00$                          134.00$                          NON-RESPONSIVE* 139.26$                            

Manufacturer/Model
 PGI BarriAire Gold Elite 

Pro 
 Globe  Lion HD396142 

GROUP B: HELMETS & HARDWARE
Cairns, 1836 #A-*B-0-B-B-E-A-A-A, with Shield #27 or #28 No Bid 509.00$                          NON-RESPONSIVE* No Bid

Cairns Face Shield - #10239142 No Bid 118.00$                          NON-RESPONSIVE* No Bid
Defender Model #10239192 No Bid 89.00$                            NON-RESPONSIVE* No Bid

GROUP C: BOOTS (ALL SIZES)
BOOTS 525.00$                          588.00$                          485.00$                            339.89$                            

Manufacturer/Model Black Diamond X2 Globe Supreme  Haix Eagle Air Black Diamond 2770912

GROUP D: GLOVES
EXTRICATION GLOVES (price per pair) 52.00$                            83.00$                            54.00$                              52.78$                              

Manufacturer/Model  Ansell Ringers R-314  Shelby 2500  Ringers 314  Ringers R-314 
STRUCTURAL GLOVES (price per pair) 127.00$                          127.00$                          125.00$                            108.79$                            

Manufacturer/Model
 Dragon Fire X2S-G  Fire Craft P5000  Dragon Fire X2S  Dragon X2-G 

DELIVERY TIME FROM ORDER PLACEMENT: Varies 75-90 Days 70-84 Days 60 Days

North America Fire 
Equipment Company

CHARLOTTE COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS
BID TABULATION

BUNKER GEAR AND ACCESSORIES - ANNUAL CONTRACT
BID NO. 20250601

MES Service Company Bennett Fire
Central Alabama 

Training Solutions (1)

Witnesses: Krista Vigne, Contract Specialist and Stacey Trowbridge, Contract Specialist



Company Name:  ►

Location:  ► Asheville, NC Sparta, NJ Tuscaloosa, AL
Description:  ▼

GROUP A: BUNKER GEAR (ALL SIZES)
COAT No Bid 2,175.00$                       NON-RESPONSIVE*

Manufacturer/Model  Fire Dex 
PANTS No Bid 1,630.00$                       NON-RESPONSIVE*

Manufacturer/Model
 Fire Dex 

HOODS No Bid 153.00$                          NON-RESPONSIVE*

Manufacturer/Model
 Fire Dex 

GROUP B: HELMETS & HARDWARE
Cairns, 1836 #A-*B-0-B-B-E-A-A-A, with Shield #27 or #28 No Bid No Bid NON-RESPONSIVE*

Cairns Face Shield - #10239142 No Bid No Bid NON-RESPONSIVE*
Defender Model #10239192 No Bid No Bid NON-RESPONSIVE*

GROUP C: BOOTS (ALL SIZES)
BOOTS No Bid No Bid 485.00$                            

Manufacturer/Model  Haix Eagle Air 

GROUP D: GLOVES
EXTRICATION GLOVES (price per pair) 46.00$                            74.00$                            54.00$                              

Manufacturer/Model  Ansell Ringer R-314  Fire Dex  Ringers 314 
STRUCTURAL GLOVES (price per pair) 111.00$                          117.00$                          125.00$                            

Manufacturer/Model
 Dragon Fire X2S  Fire Dex  Dragon Fire X2S 

DELIVERY TIME FROM ORDER PLACEMENT: 30 Days 60 Days 70-84 Days

*COMPANY WAS DEEMED
NON-RESPONSIVE DUE TO
THE PRODUCT BID WAS NOT
EQUIVALENT TO THE SPECIFICATIONS

Read's Uniforms Firefighter One, LLC
Central Alabama 

Training Solutions (2)

Witnesses: Krista Vigne, Contract Specialist and Stacey Trowbridge, Contract Specialist


