
 

DUE DATE: 06/18/2025 DEPT:  Public Works

Company Name: John Fideli 

Landscapes, LLC

Walkers Service TGA Equipment, Inc. Brightview 

Landscape Services, 

Inc.

Location: Cape Coral, FL Punta Gorda, FL Punta Gorda, FL Englewood, FL

Description:

MID COUNTY 702,380.00$                   678,160.00$             581,280.00$                724,852.70$              

WEST COUNTY No Bid 465,556.00$             378,584.00$                535,709.15$              

TOTAL 702,380.00$                   1,143,716.00$          959,864.00$                1,260,561.85$           

Non-Responsive Bidders:

Roadside Vegetation Management

P&T Lawn and Tractor Service

REVISED 7/16/25

CHARLOTTE COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS

 BID TABULATION

SAFETY MOWING OF RIGHTS OF WAY - MID AND WEST COUNTY - ANNUAL CONTRACT

BID NO. 20250440

Witnesses:    Krista Vigne, Contract Specialist and   Chastity Williams, Contract Specialist



BID OPENING DATE: 6/18/2025 DEPT: PUBLIC WORKS

Company Names ►

Location ►

Description ▼ Quantity Unit Price Extension Price Extension

A - MID COUNTY

Mowing 1,730
Per acre/per 

cycle 40.00$           69,200.00$        38.00$          65,740.00$         

Litter Removal
1,730

Per acre/per 

cycle 10.50$           18,165.00$        10.50$          18,165.00$         

Mowing Extended Price 7 cycles 69,200.00$    484,400.00$      65,740.00$   460,180.00$       

Litter Removal Extended Price 12 cycles 18,165.00$    217,980.00$      18,165.00$   217,980.00$       

A - MID COUNTY TOTAL BID PRICE 702,380.00$      678,160.00$       

B - WEST COUNTY

Mowing 1,279
Per acre/per 

cycle no bid -$                   34.00$          43,486.00$         

Litter Removal 1,279
Per acre/per 

cycle no bid -$                   10.50$          13,429.50$         

Mowing Extended Price 7 cycles no bid -$                   43,486.00$   304,402.00$       

Litter Removal Extended Price 12 cycles no bid -$                   13,429.50$   161,154.00$       

B- WEST COUNTY TOTAL BID PRICE No Bid 465,556.00$       

Non-Responsive Bidders:

Roadside Vegetation Management

P&T Lawn and Tractor Service

REVISED 7/16/25

Punta Gorda, FL Punta Gorda, FL

CHARLOTTE COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS

BID TABULATION

SAFETY MOWING OF ROADWAY RIGHTS OF WAY - MID AND WEST COUNTY - ANNUAL CONTRACT

BID NO. 20250440

John Fideli Landscapes, LLC Walkers Service

Witnesses:

Krista Vigne, Contract Specialist and Chastity Williams, Contract Specialist



BID OPENING DATE: 6/18/2025 DEPT: PUBLIC WORKS

CHARLOTTE COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS

BID TABULATION

SAFETY MOWING OF ROADWAY RIGHTS OF WAY - MID AND WEST COUNTY - ANNUAL CONTRACT

BID NO. 20250440

Company Names ►

Location ►

Description ▼ Quantity Unit Price Extension Price Extension

A - MID COUNTY

Mowing 1,730
Per acre/per 

cycle 24.00$           41,520.00$        44.89$          77,659.70$         

Litter Removal
1,730

Per acre/per 

cycle 14.00$           24,220.00$        8.73$            15,102.90$         

Mowing Extended Price 7 cycles 41,520.00$    290,640.00$      77,659.70$   543,617.90$       

Litter Removal Extended Price 12 cycles 24,220.00$    290,640.00$      15,102.90$   181,234.80$       

A - MID COUNTY TOTAL BID PRICE 581,280.00$      724,852.70$       

B - WEST COUNTY

Mowing 1,279
Per acre/per 

cycle 20.00$           25,580.00$        44.87$          57,388.73$         

Litter Removal
1,279

Per acre/per 

cycle 13.00$           16,627.00$        8.73$            11,165.67$         

Mowing Extended Price 7 cycles 25,580.00$    179,060.00$      57,388.73$   401,721.11$       

Litter Removal Extended Price 12 cycles 16,627.00$    199,524.00$      11,165.67$   133,988.04$       

B- WEST COUNTY TOTAL BID PRICE 378,584.00$      535,709.15$       

Non-Responsive Bidders:

Roadside Vegetation Management

P&T Lawn and Tractor Service

REVISED 7/16/25

Punta Gorda, FL Englewood, FL

TGA Equipment, Inc.

Brightview Landscape 

Services, Inc.

Witnesses:

Krista Vigne, Contract Specialist and Chastity Williams, Contract Specialist
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