
 

DUE DATE:  NOVEMBER 19, 2025 DEPT: COMMUNITY SERVICES

Description:  ▼ Unit of Measure Est Qty  Unit Cost Extended Price  Unit Cost Extended Price

Sodium Hypochlorite, 12.5% (bulk) gallon 5,500 2.95$             16,225.00$           

Muriatic Acid (gallon) gallon 8,460 6.5250$         55,201.50$           7.2150$         61,038.90$           

Sodium Bicarbonate (50 lbs.) pound 95,700 0.6500$         62,205.00$           0.6136$         58,721.52$           

Calcium Chloride, 77-80% (50 lbs.) pound 19,900 1.1000$         21,890.00$           0.6378$         12,692.22$           

Calcium Hypochlorite (100 lbs.) pound 3,000 3.1500$         9,450.00$             3.8216$         11,464.80$           

Calcium Hypochlorite (50 lbs.) pound 1,500 4.2548$         6,382.20$             

Calcium Hypochlorite (25 lbs.) pound 200 7.7520$         1,550.40$             

Sodium Thiosulfate (100 lbs.) pound 600 2.2000$         1,320.00$             

Sodium Thiosulfate (25 lbs.) 
1
 Only Avail 55.12lb pound 50 2.2000$         110.00$                

Cyanuric Acid (100 lbs.) pound 1,050 2.4500$         2,572.50$             3.5100$         3,685.50$             

Quick Dissolve Pool Salt (40 lbs.) pound 7,160 0.3250$         2,327.00$             0.2595$         1,858.02$             

Rock Salt (40 lbs.) pound 190,480 0.2750$         52,382.00$           0.2455$         46,762.84$           

Group "B" Non-Bulk Orders
1
Sodium Thiosulfate does not come in 25-pound increments; this bid item will be 55.12-pound line

Non-Responsive

Brenntag Mid-South Incorporated

Group 'A' - Chemicals Ordered in Bulk Quantities

Group 'B' - Non-Bulk Orders

-$                                               

NO BID

NO BID

CHARLOTTE COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS

OFFICIAL BID TABULATION

POOL CHEMICALS - ANNUAL CONTRACT

BID NO. 20250740

 Hawkins Inc 

LaBelle, Florida Jupiter, FloridaLocation:  ►

Company Name:  ► Commercial Energy Specialist

206,028.00$                                  205,586.40$                                  

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Total Estimated Annual Cost for Group 'A' 16,225.00$                                    

Total Estimated Annual Cost for Group 'B'


