CHARLOTTE COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS
BID TABULATION (REVISED)
SOD & HYDRO SEEDING - ANNUAL CONTRACT
BID NO. 20250385

DEPT: PUBLIC WORKS

Company Names » Greenscapes Innovations, Inc. Maloney's Sod Lira and Sons Sod
Location » Arcadia, FL Punta Gorda, FL Inverness, FL
Description V¥
Group A: Sod Delivered and Installed: Less than 100 S.F.
1. Argentine Bahia| $ 3.50| $ 8.00( 9% 2.50
2. St. Augustine Sod (Floratam){ $ 3.75] $ 5751 9% 4.50
3. Empire Zoysia| $ 4.75| $ 0.25] % 5.50
Group B: Delivered and Installed: More than 100 S.F. but Less Than 2,400 S.F.
1. Argentine Bahia| $ 0.64 No Bid | $ 0.90
2. St. Augustine Sod (Floratam)| $ 1.29 NoBid | $ 1.60
3. Empire Zoysia| $ 1.59 No Bid | $ 1.90
Group C: Delivered and Installed: More Than 2,400 S.F. But Less Than 7,200 S.F.
1. Argentine Bahia| $ 0.49 No Bid | $ 0.50
2. St. Augustine Sod (Floratam)| $ 0.59 NoBid | $ 0.90
3. Empire Zoysia| $ 1.44 No Bid | $ 1.20
Group D: Delivered and Installed - More Than 7,200 S.F.
1. Argentine Bahia| $ 0.40 No Bid | $ 0.34
2. St. Augustine Sod (Floratam){ $ 0.56 No Bid | $ 0.50
3. Empire Zoysia| $ 1.04 NoBid | $ 0.70
Group E: Pickup and/or Delivery of Pallet:
1. Argentine Bahia| $ 190.00 No Bid | $ 160.00
2. St. Augustine Sod (Floratam){ $ 255.00 No Bid | $ 240.00
3. Empire Zoysia| $ 270.00 No Bid | $ 30.00
Group F: Hydro Seeding:
1. Install Hydro-seed| $ 0.19 No Bid | § 1.90
2. Install Hydro-see with Tacofier| $ 0.23 No Bid No Bid
Pallet Charge, which is refundable for full credit Included No Bid $ 10.00

No Bid: SiteOne Landscape Supply

Witnesses: Krista Vigne, Contract Specialist and Sheri Strong, Senior Contract Specialist



