
DUE DATE:10/30/2024 DEPT: Public Safety
Company Name:  ►

Location:  ► St. Petersburg, FL Woodstock, GA Decautur, AL Laurinburg, NC
Description:  ▼

GROUP A: BUNKER GEAR (ALL SIZES)
COAT 2,350.00$                       1,890.00$                       NO BID 2,358.00$                       

Manufacturer/Model  Morning Pride Coat  Globe GXCEL  Morning Pride Tails 
PANTS 1,600.00$                       1,519.00$                       NO BID 1,780.00$                       

Manufacturer/Model
 Morning Pride Pro Fit  Globe GPS  Morning Pride Pro Fit 

HOODS 115.00$                          124.00$                          NO BID 73.00$                            

Manufacturer/Model

 PGI BarriAire Gold Elite 
Pro 

 Globe 
 Halo 360NB / Majestic 
360 HALO Particulate 

Hood 

Cairns, 1836 #A-*B-0-B-B-E-A-A-A, with Shield #27 or #28 NON-RESPONSIVE* 489.00$                          NO BID NO BID
Cairns Face Shield - #10239142 NON-RESPONSIVE* 111.00$                          NO BID NO BID

Defender Model #10239192 NON-RESPONSIVE* 79.00$                            NO BID NO BID

GROUP C: BOOTS (ALL SIZES) 355.00$                          549.00$                          408.96$                          NON-RESPONSIVE*

Manufacturer/Model Black Diamond X2 Globe Shadow
 Haix Men's 507530/ 

Women's 507531 NON-RESPONSIVE*

DELIVERY TIME FROM ORDER PLACEMENT: 60 days 75-90 days 15-30 days 60 days

*GROUP B WAS DEEMED 
NON-RESPONSIVE DUE 
TO THE PRODUCT BID 
WAS NOT EQUIVALENT 

TO THE SPECIFICATIONS

*GROUP C WAS DEEMED 
NON-RESPONSIVE DUE 
TO THE PRODUCT BID 
WAS NOT EQUIVALENT 

TO THE SPECIFICATIONS

GROUP B: HELMETS & HARDWARE

CHARLOTTE COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS
BID TABULATION

BUNKER GEAR AND ACCESSORIES - ANNUAL CONTRACT
BID NO. 2024000639

Municipal Emergency 
Services Bennet Fire Products

North America Fire 
Equipment Company, 

Inc.
Advanced Emergency 
Services Training, Inc.

Witnesses: Chastity Williams, Contract Specialist and Michael Gallagher, Contract Specialist


