BID FORM INSECTICIDES AND HERBICIDES – ANNUAL CONTRACT BID NO. 2024000622

TO: Senior Division Manager - Purchasing Board of County Commissioners Charlotte County Administration Center 18500 Murdock Circle Port Charlotte, Florida 33948-1094

The undersigned, as bidder, does hereby declare that he has read the Request for Bids, Instructions to Bidders, Technical Specifications & Conditions, Safety & Health Requirements, Bid Form, and any other documentation for

INSECTICIDES AND HERBICIDES - ANNUAL CONTRACT

and further agrees to furnish all items listed on the attached Bid Form in accordance with the unit price(s) submitted. The above specified documents are herein incorporated into the Bid Form and shall be defined as the contract documents.

Delivery Time: 72 hours (3 days) from receipt of the order

Name

Please	indicate by (ee) that you have included the following documentation with your bid:
() /	Material Safety Data Sheets (MSDS) and Labels
(X)	Proof of Authorized Florida Distributor: As per TS-05, All Bidders must provide statement from manufacturer of
/	any/all product(s) bid, showing Bidder to be an authorized distributor within the State of Florida for said product.
(4/	Byrd Anti-Lobbying Certification
UX	HIJMAN TRAFFICKING AFFIDAVIT for Nongovernmental Entities Pursuant To FS. \$787.06

NOTE: In accordance with Florida Statues, Section 119.071(1)(b)2: Sealed bids, proposals, or replies received by an agency pursuant to a competitive solicitation are exempt from s. 119.071(1)(b)2 and s. 24(a), Art. I of the State Constitution, except as provided by Florida Statutes 255.0518, until such time as the agency provides notice of an intended decision or until 30 days after opening the bids, proposals, or final replies, whichever is earlier. Upon release of the intended decision, if you wish to obtain the quote results, you may do so by visiting our Website at http://purchasingbids.charlottecountyfl.gov/ under "Purchasing Bids Online", document number 246224. No information regarding the submittal will be divulged over the telephone.

OPTIONAL ELECTRONIC BID SUBMISSIONS: If your firm would like to submit your bid electronically, please visit http://bit.ly/3TYAyKa and follow given instructions.

of Bidder:	ORION SOLUTIONS,	LLC
Southern Schild Association (Southern Southern S	(This form to be returned)	
	20	BID NO. 2024000622

SCHEDULE OF PRICING

PRO	DDUCT NAME	PREFERRED UNIT PACKAGING	PREFERRED UNIT PRICE	PRICE PER GALLON/POUND	EXCEPTION
NAI	ME BRAND PRODUCT – NO SUBSTITU	JTIONS			
1	Dibrom Concentrate	30-gallon drum	\$ NO BID	\$ 100 BID	
2	Altosid Briquets - 150 day	220/case		\$ NO BIO	
3	Altosid Liquid (5%)	4-gallons/case	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BIO	
4	Altosid Liquid (20%)	2 x 2.5 gal./case	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	
5	Altosid Pellets	44-pound case	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BLD	
6	Zenivex E4	120-gallon mini tote	\$ NO BID	\$ 100 B10	
7	Captain XTR	2.5-gallon	\$ 91.875	\$ 36,75/gAL	
8	Reward	2.5-gallon		\$ NO BID	
9	Cutrine® - Plus Algecide- Granular	30-pound bag	\$ 81.00	\$ 2.70/16.	
10	Delagard	gallon	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID,	
11	Sonsar SRP	40-pound pail	\$ 1514,00	\$ 39,35/16.	
12	Avast	gallon	\$ 2180.71	\$ 2180.71/QA	
13	Trycera (aquatic use)	gallon	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	
14	Garlon 4	gallon	\$ 65.00	\$ 65.00/GAL	
15	Diquat SPC	gallon	\$ 50.25	\$ 50.25/901.	,
16	Natular G30	40-pound bag	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	
17	Natular XRT	220 tablet/case	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	
18	Central Life Sciences Duplex-G Larvicide	40-pound bag	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	
19	Duet - Adulticide	30-gal. drum	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	
20	Fourstar	35-pound bag	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BLD	
21	Metalarve-Larvicide-Granular (Adapco)	40-pound bag	\$ 100 B10	\$ NO BLD	
22	Metalarve-Larvicide-Granular (Clarke CLS p35)	40-pound bag	\$ NO BID		
23	Top Film - Adjuvant	2.5-gallon	\$ 170.00	\$ 68,7901.	
24	Vectobac-AS	2.5-gallon	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	
25	Vectobac-AS	30-gallon drum	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	

ORION SOLVITONS, LLC
(This form to be returned) Name of Bidder:____

PRC	DUCT NAME	PREFERRED UNIT PACKAGING	PREFERRED UNIT PRICE	PRICE PER GALLON/POUND	EXCEPTION
NAN	ME BRAND PRODUCT – NO SUBSTITU	JTIONS (CON'T)			
26	Vectoprime FG	pound	\$ NO BID	\$ 100 B10	
27	Vectobac - GS	40-pound bag	\$100 B10	\$ 100 B10	
28	Vectomax - FG	40-pound bag	\$ 100 BID	\$100 BID	The state of the s
29	Vectobac - GR	40-pound bag	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	3
30	Zenivex E20	275-gallon mini tote	\$ NO BID	\$ 100 BID	
31	Tribune	gallon	\$ 100 \$0	\$ NOBIO	
32	Rodeo	275-gallon mini tote	\$ 6558.75	\$ 24.75/gAL	AOVAMASTER 265901 toke
33	Basil Oil	2.5 gallon	\$ 42.50	\$ 17.00/90/	NOVITA BASALCIL
34	Greenclean-Pro	50-pound bag	\$ NO BID	\$ NOB1-D	
35	Alligare Triclopyr4	gallon	\$ 47.35	\$ 47.35/gAL	
36	Kontrol 30/30	275-gallon mini tote	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	
37	Vectomax WSP	2.5 gallon	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	
38	AquaStrike	2.5 gallon	\$ 191.875	\$ 76.75/GAL	
39	Aquathol Super K	20-pound bag	\$ 430.00	\$ 21.50/16	The state of the s
40	Sonar A.S.	gallon	\$ 2077.94	\$ 2077.94/94	
41	Trycera (aquatic use)	2.5 gallon	\$ NO BID	, ,	
42	Duet-HD Adulticide	30-gallon drum	\$ NO BID	\$ NO Bio	
43	Fyfanon EW	2.5 gallon	\$160 BID	\$ NO BID	
44	Merus Adulticide	2.5 gallon	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	100
45	ReMoa TRI	30-gallon drum	\$ NO BID	\$ NOBID	
46	Fallout LQ	2.5-gallon	\$ NOO BID	\$ NO BID	
47	Fallout LQ	30-gallon drum	\$100 B10	\$ NO BIO	
48	Sumilary 0.5G WSP	400x25g packets/case	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	
49	Sumilary 0.5G	10 x1kg bags/case	\$ NO BID	\$ NO Bio	-
50	ProcellaCOR by Seapro	prescription dose unit (PDU)	\$ 46.00	\$ 46.00 / PAL	/
51	Reign Drift Agent by Loveland	gallon	\$ NO BIE	<u> </u>	

ORION SOLUTIONS, LLC
(This form to be returned)
22 Name of Bidder:_

PRO	DDUCT NAME	PREFERRED UNIT	PREFERRED UNIT PRICE	PRICE PER GALLON/POUND	EXCEPTION
GEN	IERICS – NON-BRAND SPECIFIC:				
52	B.T.I. (11% or higher)	30-gallon drum	\$ NO BID	\$ 100 BiD	
53	B.T.I. (11% or higher)	2.5 gallon	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	
 54	Permanone 30-30	275-gallon mini tote	\$ 140 BID	\$ 100 B10	
55	Permanone 30-30	gallon	\$ 100 B10	\$ 100 BID	
56	Deltmethrin	gallon	\$ NO BID	\$ NOBID	
57	2,4-D amine 46% (aquatic)	2.5-gallon	\$ 45.00	\$ 18.00/9AL	Allegare
58	Copper Algecide-Liquid	2.5-gallon	\$ 59.625	\$ 23.85/ga	Alligare ARgos
59	Copper Sulfate Pentahydrate 99%	30-gallon	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	•
60	Copper Sulfate Pentahydrate 99%	50-pound bag	\$ NO BID	\$ NOBID	
61	Diquat dibromide 37.3% (aquatic)	2.5-gallon	\$ 125.00	\$ 50.00 /94	Allgare
62	Fluridone 41.7% (aquatic)	2.5-gallon	\$ 4497.50	\$ 1799.00/gaz	Allgare
63	Glyphosate 53.8% (aquatic)	2.5-gallon	\$ NO BID	\$ 100 BID	
64	Glyphosate 41% (terrestrial)	2.5-gallon	\$ NO BID	\$ NO RID	
65	Hydrogen Peroxide Algaecide	15-gallon	\$ NO BID	\$ NOBIO	
66	Triclopyr Amine 44.4% (aquatic)	2.5-gallon	\$ 105.00	\$42.00/9AL	Tahoe 3A
67	Triclopry Ester 61.6%	2.5 _15-gallon	\$ //8.375	\$ 47.35/gac	PRICED 2,5 9AL DO PROVIDE 309AI - TR
68	Spray Indicator Dye	2.5 15-gallon	\$ 80.00	\$ 32.00/9AL	PROVIDE 309AL-TR NOW to SMO 2,59AL
69	Surfactant, 90% Nonionic	gallon	\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00/9AL	Novrta 90
70	90/10 Non-ionic Spreader/Sticker	gallon	\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00/9AL	Novita 90
71	Malathion	gallon	\$ NO BID	\$ NOBID	
72	Cutrine Liquid	2.5-gallon	\$ 65,25	\$ 26.10/9AL	

		1.00
DRION	SOLUTIONS.	1-6

Name	۸f	D:	44	or.
Name	VI.	LJ IV	uч	CI.

If notified of the acceptance of this bid form, the undersigned agrees to execute a Contract for the stated compensation in the form as prescribed by the County, within the time constraints outlined in Instructions to Bidders.

The signature below is a guarantee that the Bidder will not withdraw his/her bid for a period of 60 days after the scheduled time for opening the bids.

In accordance with section 287.135, Florida Statutes, the undersigned certifies that the company is not on the Scrutinized Companies with Activities in Sudan List, the Scrutinized Companies with Activities in the Iran Petroleum Energy Sector List and does not have business operations in Cuba or Syria (if applicable) or the Scrutinized Companies that Boycott Israel List or is not participating in a boycott of Israel.

All contract documents (i.e.; performance and payment bond, cashier's check, bid bond) shall be in the name of "Charlotte County".

The undersigned acknowledges receipt of the following addends, and the cost if any of such revisions has been included in

the price bid.
Addendum No, Dated; Addendum No, Dated; Addendum No, Dated
Addendum No, Dated; Addendum No, Dated; Addendum No, Dated
HOLD HARMLESS AGREEMENT:
Type of Organization (Please Check One): Individual Ownership Joint Venture
Partnership Corporation Name of Bidding Firm ORION SOLUTIONS, LLC ABA The ORION COMPANIES. LAS
Mailing Address 1035 FRANKLIN St. Suite 207
Location Address
City & State KOCKY MOUNT, VA ZIP 24/5/ Telephone: 205-960-6325 E-mail: MNANCE P The orion Companies, US
Telephone: 205-960-6325 E-mail: MNance P theorion companies, us
Signature of person authorized to bind the Company:
Print Name/Title of person authorized to bind the Company: Hopson Wance, CFO
Date: 10/18/24

SOURCE OF SUPPLY AND SUBCONTRACTORS

The following sources of supply and subcontractors shall be used for INSECTICIDES AND HERBICIDES – ANNUAL CONTRACT. (If quoter does not have a source of supply or subcontractor, insert "to be determined". When source or subcontractor is determined, selection will be subject to County approval. If not applicable, please state N/A).

	Source of Supply Subcontractor(s)
1	see price list 1
2	2
3	3
4	4
5	5
6.	6
	DRUG FREE WORKPLACE FORM
	The undersigned vendor in accordance with Florida Statute 287.087 hereby certifies that <u>ORION SOLUTIONS</u> , <i>L</i> (name of business) does:
	1. Publish a statement notifying employees that the unlawful manufacture, distribution, dispensing, possession, or use of a controlled substance is prohibited in the workplace and specifying the actions that will be taken against employees for violations of such prohibition.
	2. Inform employees about the dangers of drug abuse in the workplace, the business's policy of maintaining a drug-free workplace, any available drug counseling, rehabilitation, and employee assistance programs, and the penalties that may be imposed upon employees for drug abuse violations.
	3. Give each employee engaged in providing the commodities or contractual services that are under bid a copy of the statement specified in subsection (1).
	4. In the statement specified in subsection (1), notify the employees that, as a condition of working on the commodities or contractual services that are under bid, the employee will abide by the terms of the statement and will notify the employer of any conviction of, or plea of guilty or nolo contendere to, any violation of Chapter 893 or of any controlled substance law of the United States or any state, for a violation occurring in the workplace no later than five (5) days after such conviction.
	5. Impose a sanction on, or require the satisfactory participation in a drug abuse assistance or rehabilitation program if such is available in the employee's community, by any employee who is so convicted.
	6. Make a good faith effort to continue to maintain a drug-free workplace through implementation of this section.
	As the person authorized to sign the statement, I certify that this firm complies fully with the above requirements.
	Signature
	Dated

(This form to be returned)

BYRD ANTI-LOBBYING CERTIFICATION

Certification for Contracts, Grants, Loans, and Cooperative Agreements

The undersigned certifies, to the best of his or her knowledge and belief, that:

- (1) No Federal appropriated funds have been paid or will be paid, by or on behalf of the undersigned, to any person for influencing or attempting to influence an officer or employee of any agency, a Member of Congress, an officer or employee of Congress, or an employee of a Member of Congress in connection with the awarding of any Federal contract, the making of an Federal grant, the making of any Federal loan, the entering into of any cooperative agreement, and the extension, continuation, renewal, amendment, or modification of any Federal contract, grant, loan, or cooperative agreement.
- (2) If any funds other than Federal appropriated funds have been paid or will be paid to any person for influencing or attempting to influence an officer or employee of any agency, a Member of Congress, an officer or employee of Congress, or an employee of a Member of Congress in connection with this Federal contract, grant, loan, or cooperative agreement, the undersigned shall complete and submit Standard Form-LLL, "Disclosure Form to Report Lobbying," in accordance with its instructions.
- (3) The undersigned shall require that the language of this certification be included in the award documents for all subawards at all tiers (including subcontracts, subgrants, and contracts under grants, loans and cooperative agreements) and that all subrecipients shall certify and disclose accordingly.

This certification is a material representation of fact upon which reliance was placed when this transaction was made or entered into. Submission of this certification is a prerequisite for making or entering into this transaction imposed by Section 1352, Title 31, U.S.C. Any person who fails to file the required certification shall be subject to a civil penalty of not less than \$10,000 and not more than \$100,000 for each such failure.

Date

Hopson Nance
Type or Print Name

Signature

CFO

Title

Name of Bidder: ORIM SOLV TIONS, LLC

(This form to be returned)

HUMAN TRAFFICKING AFFIDAVIT for Nongovernmental Entities Pursuant To FS. §787.06

Charlotte County Contract #2024000622

The undersigned on behalf of the entity listed below, (the "Nongovernmental Entity"), hereby attests under penalty of perjury as follows:

- 1. I am over the age of 18 and I have personal knowledge of the matters set forth except as otherwise set forth herein.
- 2. I am an officer or representative of the Nongovernmental Entity and authorized to provide this affidavit on the Company's behalf.
- 3. Nongovernmental Entity does not use coercion for labor or services as defined in Section 787.06, Florida Statutes.
- 4. This declaration is made pursuant to Section 92.525, Florida Statutes. I understand that making a false statement in this declaration may subject me to criminal penalties.

Under penalties of perjury, I declare that I have read the foregoing Human Trafficking Affidavit and that the facts stated in it are true.

Furth e f Affiant sayeth naught.	
Signature	
Holson Nance	
Printed Name	
CFO	
Title	
ORION SOLUTIONS, LLC	
Nongovernmental Entity	
10/18/24	
Date /	

Name of Bidder:___

ORION SOLUTIONS, LLC

(This form to be returned)

27

BID NO. 2024000622



PURCHASING DIVISION

Charlotte County Administration Center 18500 Murdock Circle Port Charlotte, Florida 33948-1094

> Telephone (941) 743-1378 Facsimile (941) 743-1384

OCTOBER 14, 2024

PROSPECTIVE BIDDERS TO:

2024000622 INSECTICIDES AND HERBICIDES - ANNUAL CONTRACT RE:

BID DUE DATE: OCTOBER 23, 2024 @ 2:00 PM, EST,

ADDENDUM NO. 1

Bidders are hereby notified that this addendum shall be made a part of the above-named proposal and contract documents. The following is issued to modify, and/or clarify the bid and contract documents. These items shall have the same force and effect as the original bid and contract documents, and bids to be submitted on the specified bid date, shall conform with the additions, deletions and revisions listed as herein.

BID DUE DATE EXTENDED: BID DUE DATE IS HEREBY EXTENDED TO OCTOBER 23, 2024 @ 2:00 PM, EST.

This addendum is binding and is to be considered as if contained within the original bid documents of Bid No. 2024000622. Bidders are required to acknowledge receipt of this addendum on their Bid Forms.

Kimberly A. Corbett, C.P.M., CPPB Senior Division Manager - Purchasing

Kimberly Corbett

KAC/kv

File Cc:

10-15-24

To whom it may concern:

Orion Solutions, LLC, is an authorized distributor of all Nufarm Herbicides.

I appreciate your attention to this matter.

Please let me know if you need anything else from me.

Respectfully,

Brian J Corbitt

IVM/R&P Segment Lead – Nufarm NA





Requesting Entity,

This letter is to confirm that Orion Solutions, Inc. is a Corteva Authorized Distributor for Corteva Vegetation Management brands during the 2024-2025 Market Year. The market year begins October 1st, 2024, and ends September 30th, 2025.

If further questions arise, feel free to reach me directly or view more information at vegetationmgmt.com or Corteva.US

Best regards,

Travis Hirst

Account Manager

Corteva Agriscience

travis.hirst@corteva.com

(620)960-0496



Biosorb® Products

5988 Mid Rivers Mall Drive, Suite 124, St. Charles, Missouri 63304-7119 USA 636-936-1400

www.Biosorb-Inc.com

October 10, 2024

To Whom It May Concern:

Biosorb Inc. is the manufacturer of TopFilm™, the organic certified natural-based sticker, and Biosorb Inc. approves the Orion Companies, www.theorioncompanies.us, to be a distributor of our products.

If you need more information, please contact us directly.

Thank you,

Lucía G.I. Marshall, Ph.D.

Lucia & . A. Marshell

President



Envu Vegetation Management 5000 Centregreen Way Suite 400 Cary, NC 27513

October 8, 2024

To whom it may concern,

Orion Solutions, LLC is an approved, authorized distributor of Envu Vegetation Management products.

Sincerely, Halley Granitz Envu Vegetation Management



10/17/2024

To whom it may concern:

Orion Solutions, LLC, is an authorized distributor of Novita Products.

10/17/24

James Martin

COO, Novita Solutions LLC



Bayer CropScience LP 800 North Lindbergh Blvd St Louis, MO 63141

October 8, 2024

To Whom it May Concern:

The Orion Companies, dba "Orion Solutions LLC" is an authorized distributor for Bayer CropScience LP in the United States for our non-crop glyphosate brands.

As an authorized distributor, their employees are trained on proper product stewardship and their facilities are inspected to be sure they comply with all product safety and security requirements.

Bayer CropScience glyphosate products sold through Orion Solutions, LLC include all pack sizes of these brands:

•	Aquamaster TM Herbicide	EPA Registration number	524-343
•	Roundup Custom® Herbicide	EPA Registration number	524-343
•	Roundup ProMax® Herbicide	EPA Registration number	524-579
•	Roundup ProConcentrate® Herbicide	EPA Registration number	524-529
•	Ranger Pro® Herbicide	EPA Registration number	524-517
•	Roundup QuikPro® Herbicide	EPA Registration number	524-525

Sincerely:

Michael Owen

Global IT&O Commercial Lead



UPL NA Inc. 15401 Weston Parkway Suite 170 Cary, NC 27513 w: upl-ltd.com/us

October 8, 2024

To whom it may concern:

Orion Solutions, LLC, is an authorized distributor of UPL aquatic herbicides. This includes the following products in various package sizes:

- Aquastrike
- Aquathol K
- Aquathol Super K
- Cascade
- Current
- Hydrothol 191
- Hydrothol Granular
- Symmetry NXG
- Teton
- Top Deck

Thank you for your continued support.

Dean Jones

Territory Sales Manager - Aquatics

(863) 514-6934

Dear Jone

dean.jones@upl-ltd.com



SePRO Corporation • 11550 North Meridian Street • Suite 600 • Carmel, Indiana 46032-4565

October 8, 2024

To Whom It May Concern,

This communication serves to confirm Orion Solutions, LLC is an authorized Agent and Distributor of SePRO aquatic products.

Please contact me if you have any questions.

Regards,

Shaun Hyde

Director, Aquatics

SePRO Corporation

shaunh@sepro.com



Authorized Distributor Certificate

10/08/2024

To whom it may concern,

This letter is to certify that Orion Solutions, LLC. of is an official Alligare Distributor, and Reseller within the U.S.A. As an official product partner of Alligare, Orion Solutions, LLC. has the full support of Alligare; ensuring product quality, technical support, and warranty.

Zach Hilditch

Marketing Director

Alligare, LLC