CHARLOTTE COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS
REINFORCED CONCRETE CULVERT PIPE - ELLIPTICAL ANNUAL CONTRACT
NO. 20250398
Due Date: 05/28/2025 Dept: Public Works

PART 1 WITH HOLES

COMPANY NAME Rinker Materials
Location Miami, Florida
PART 1 With Lift Holes GROUP A GROUP A
QTY Per Foot Cost Extended Per Foot Cost Extended

12" x 18" 8 No Bid No Bid $ - $
14" x 23" 8 No Bid No Bid $ - $
19" x 30" 8 No Bid No Bid $ - $
24" x 38" 8 No Bid No Bid $ - $
29" x 45" 8 No Bid No Bid $ - $
34" x 53" 8 No Bid No Bid $ - $
38" x 60" 8 No Bid No Bid $ - $
43" x 68" 8 No Bid No Bid $ - $
48" x 76" 8 No Bid No Bid $ - $
53" x 83" 8 No Bid No Bid $ - $
58" x 91" 8 No Bid No Bid $ - $
68" x106" 8 No Bid No Bid $ - $

SUBTOTAL No Bid SUBTOTAL| $

Mitered End Sections 4 to 1 GROUP B GROUP B
QTY Each Extended Each Extended

12" x 18" 1 No Bid No Bid $ - $
14" x 23" 1 No Bid No Bid $ - $
19" x 30" 1 No Bid No Bid $ - $
24" x 38" 1 No Bid No Bid $ - $
29" x 45" 1 No Bid No Bid $ - $
34" x 53" 1 No Bid No Bid $ - $
38" x 60" 1 No Bid No Bid $ - $
43" x 68" 1 No Bid No Bid $ - $
48" x 76" 1 No Bid No Bid $ - $
53" x 83" 1 No Bid No Bid $ - $
58" x 91" 1 No Bid No Bid $ - $
68" x106" 1 No Bid No Bid $ - $

SUBTOTAL No Bid SUBTOTAL| $




CHARLOTTE COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS
REINFORCED CONCRETE CULVERT PIPE - ELLIPTICAL
NO. 20250398

PART 1 WITH HOLES (Continued)

COMPANY NAME Rinker Materials
Location Miami, FL
Mitered End Sections 2 to 1 GROUP C GROUP C
QTY Each Extended Each Extended
12" x 18" 1 No Bid No Bid $ - $
14" x 23" 1 No Bid No Bid $ - $
19" x 30" 1 No Bid No Bid $ - $
24" x 38" 1 No Bid No Bid $ - $
29" x 45" 1 No Bid No Bid $ - $
34" x 53" 1 No Bid No Bid $ - $
38" x 60" 1 No Bid No Bid $ - $
43" x 68" 1 No Bid No Bid $ - $
48" x 76" 1 No Bid No Bid $ - $
53" x 83" 1 No Bid No Bid $ - $
58" x 91" 1 No Bid No Bid $ - $
68" x106" 1 No Bid No Bid $ - $
SUBTOTAL No Bid SUBTOTAL| $
TOTAL PART 1 NO BID TOTAL PART 1 $
PART 2 WITHOUT HOLES
COMPANY NAME Rinker Materials
Miami, FL
PART 2 Without Lift Holes GROUP A GROUP A
QTY Per Foot Cost Extended Per Foot Cost Extended

12" x 18" 5200 $ 4500 | $ 234,000.00 $ - $
14" x 23" 2720 $ 55.80 | $ 151,776.00 $ - $
19" x 30" 2096 $ 90.00 | $ 188,640.00 $ - $
24" x 38" 864 $ 13050 | $ 112,752.00 $ - $
29" x 45" 320 $ 180.00 | $ 57,600.00 $ - $
34" x 53" 288 $ 243.00 | $ 69,984.00 $ - $
38" x 60" 232 $ 297.00 | $ 68,904.00 $ - $
43" x 68" 8 $ 38250 | $ 3,060.00 $ - $
48" x 76" 8 $ 47250 | $ 3,780.00 $ - $
53" x 83" 8 $ 74250 | $ 5,940.00 $ - $




CHARLOTTE COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS
REINFORCED CONCRETE CULVERT PIPE - ELLIPTICAL
NO. 20250398

PART 2 WITHOUT HOLES (Continued)

COMPANY NAME Rinker Materials
Location Miami, FL
58" x 91" 8 $ 765.00 | $ 6,120.00 $ - $
68" x106" 8 $ 1,089.00 | $ 8,712.00 $ - $

SUBTOTAL| $ 911,268.00 SUBTOTAL| $
PART 2 Mitered End 4 to 1 GROUP B GROUP B

QTY Each Extended Each Extended

12" x 18" 1 $ 585.00 | $ 585.00 $ - $
14" x 23" 1 $ 675.00 | $ 675.00 $ - $
19" x 30" 1 $ 855.00 | $ 855.00 $ - $
24" x 38" 1 $ 1,125.00 | $ 1,125.00 $ - $
29" x 45" 1 $ 3,150.00 | $ 3,150.00 $ - $
34" x 53" 1 $ 3,960.00 | $ 3,960.00 $ - $
38" x 60" 1 $ 4,770.00 | $ 4,770.00 $ - $
43" x 68" 1 $ 6,300.00 | $ 6,300.00 $ - $
48" x 76" 1 $ 6,975.00 | $ 6,975.00 $ - $
53" x 83" 1 $ 14,760.00 | $ 14,760.00 $ - $
58" x 91" 1 $ 15,300.00 | $ 15,300.00 $ - $
68" x106" 1 $ 42,500.00 | $ 42,500.00 $ - $

SUBTOTAL $100,955.00 SUBTOTAL| $

Mitered End Sections 2 to 1 GROUP C GROUP C
QTY Each Extended Each Extended

12" x 18" 1 $ 585.00 | $ 585.00 $ - $
14" x 23" 1 $ 675.00 | $ 675.00 $ - $
19" x 30" 1 $ 855.00 | $ 855.00 $ - $
24" x 38" 1 $ 1,125.00 | $ 1,125.00 $ - $
29" x 45" 1 $ 1,575.00 | $ 1,575.00 $ - $
34" x 53" 1 $ 1,980.00 | $ 1,980.00 $ - $
38" x 60" 1 $ 2,385.00 | $ 2,385.00 $ - $
43" x 68" 1 $ 3,150.00 | $ 3,150.00 $ - $
48" x 76" 1 $ 6,975.00 | $ 6,975.00 $ - $




CHARLOTTE COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS

REINFORCED CONCRETE CULVERT PIPE - ELLIPTICAL

NO. 20250398

COMPANY NAME Rinker Materials
Miami, FL
53" x 83" 1 $ 7,380.00 | $ 7,380.00 $ - $
58" x 91" 1 $ 7,650.00 | $ 7,650.00 $ - $
68" x106" 1 $ 21,250.00 | $ 21,250.00 $ - $
SUBTOTAL| $ 55,585.00 SUBTOTAL| $
TOTAL PART 2 $ 1,067,808.00 TOTALPART2 | $
PART 3 ROUND RCP
QTY Per Foot Cost Extended Per Foot Cost Extended
A. 72" Round RCP 96 $ 495.00 | $ 47,520.00 $ - $
B. 72" Mitered End 4 to 1 1 $ 14,400.00 | $ 14,400.00 $ - $
C. 72" Mitered End 2 to 1 1 $ 9,598.50 | $ 9,598.50 $ - $
D. 24" Round RCP 64 $ 55.80 | $ 3,571.20 $ - $
36" Round RCP 64 $ 117.00 | $ 7,488.00 $ - $
48" Round RCP 64 $ 19350 | $ 12,384.00 $ - $
TOTAL PART 3 $ 94,961.70 TOTALPART3 | $
STANDARD PIPE LGTH 8’
Delivery Time (all pipe types) 15-30 days




