BID FORM
INSECTICIDES AND HERBICIDES —~ ANNUAL CONTRACT
BID NO. 2024000061

TO: Senior Division Manager - Purchasing
Board of County Commissioners
Charlotte County Administration Center
18500 Murdock Circle
Port Charlotte, Fiorida 33948-1094

The undersigned, as bidder, does hereby declare that he has read the Request for Bids, Instructions to Bidders, Technical
Specifications & Conditions, Safety & Health Requirements, Bid Form, and any other documentation for

INSECTICIDES AND HERBICIDES ~ ANNUAL CONTRACT

and further agrees to furnish all items listed on the attached Bid Form in accordance with the unit price(s) submitted. The
above specified documents are herein incorporated into the Bid Form and shall be defined as the contract documents.

Delivery Time: 72 hours (3 days) from receipt of the order
Please indicate by (V) that you have included the following documentation with your bid:

(\/ Material Safety Data Sheets (MSDS) and Labels
(v} Proof of Authorized Florida Distributor: As per TS-05, Ali Bidders must provide statement from manufacturer of
any/all product(s) bid, showing Bidder to be an authorized distributor within the State of Florida for said product.

NOTE: In accordance with Florida Statues, Section 119.071(1)(b)2: Sealed bids, proposals, or replies received by an agency
pursuant to a competitive solicitation are exempt from s. 119.071(1)(b)2 and s. 24(a), Art. | of the State Constitution, except
as provided by Florida Statutes 255.0518, until such time as the agency provides notice of an intended decision or until 30
days after opening the bids, proposals, or final replies, whichever is earlier. Upon release of the intended decision, if you
wish to obtain the quote resuits, you may do so by visiting our Website at htip://purchasingbids.charlottecountyfl. gov/ under
‘Purchasing Bids Online”, document number 240614. No information regarding the submittal will be divulged over the
telephone.

OPTIONAL ELECTRONIC BID SUBMISSIONS: If your firm would like to submit your bid electronically, please visit
hitp://bit. y/3TYAyKa and follow given instructions.

Name of Bidder: ADAPCO, LLC

{This form to be returned)
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SCHEDULE OF PRICING

PREFERRED
PRODUCT NAME UNIT UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE PER EXCEPTION
- | PACKAGING GALLON/POUND
Name Brand Product — No Substitutions: - ‘
1 | Dibrom Concentrate 30-gallon drum | ¢ 8 446 50/dr | §281.55/g|
5 | Altosid Briquets — 150 Day 220/case $No Bid $
3 | Altosid Liquid (5%) 4 galions/case | ¢ No Bid $
2x25 4
4 | Altosid Liquid (20%) gallon/case | $No Bid $
44-pound .
5 | Altosid Pellets case $ No Bid $
120-gallon i
6 | Zenivex mini-tote g No Bid $
7 | Captain XTR 2.5-gallon ¢ No Bid $
8 | Reward 2 3-gallon ¢ No Bid $
Cutrine®-Plus Algecide- . _
9 | Granular 30-pound bag | ¢ No Bid $
10 | Deltagard gallon ¢ No Bid $
11 | Sonar SRP 40-pound pail | $No Bid $
12 | Avast gallon s No Bid $
13 | Trycera (aguatic use) gallon ¢ No Bid $
14 | Garlon 4 galion $ No Bid 3
15 _| Diguat SPC galion $No Bid $
16_| Natular G30 40-pound bag | ¢ No Bid $
220 tablet/ }
17 | Natular XRT case $No Bid $
Central Life Sciences Duplex-G A8-pound ba )
18 | Larvicide P 9 | gNoBid $
19| Duet - Adulticide 30-gallon drum | ¢ No Bid 5
20 | Fourstar 35-pound bag $No Bid s
Metalarv S-PT (40lb bag) 40lb bag )
21 | Metalarve-Larvicide-Granular E{OU% $1,223.20/bg | $30.58/lb
22 | Top Film-Adjuvant 2.5-gallon s No Bid $
23 | Duplex-G Larvicide 40-pound bag s No Bid $
Vectobac 12AS Strain AM 65-52 2 5-qalion
24 | Vectobac-AS 2°9aIoN o 45100/cs | § 32.24/g) Packaged in a 2x2.5 gl case
Vectobac 12AS Strain AM 65-52 , _ ,
25 | Vectobac-AS 30-gallon drum $ 967 20/dr $ 32.24/gl

Name of Bidder: ADAPCO, LLC

(This form to be returned)
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SCHEDULE OF PRICING ~ CONTINUED

PREFERRED
PRODUCT NAME UNIT UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE PER EXCEPTION
PACKAGING GALLON/POUND
26 | Vectoprime FG pound $ 174.80/bg $4.37/b
27 | Vectobac GS 40-pound bag | $ 69.20/bg $ 1.73/b
28 | Vectomax FG 40-pound bag | $403.20/bg $ 10.08/Ib
Vectobac GR
29 | Vectrobac GR 40-pound bag | $ 108.40/bg $ 2.71/b
275-gallon ‘
30 | Zenivex E20 mini-tote $ No Bid $
31 | Tribune galion ¢ No Bid $
275-galion )
32 | Rodeo mini-tote $ No Bid $
33 | Basil Oil galion $ No Bid $
34 | Greenclean-Pro 50-pound bag | $ No Bid $
35 | Alligare Triclopyr4 gallon $ No Bid 3
275-gallon )
36 | Kontrol 30/30 mini-tote $ No Bid $
800 WSP/Case .
38 | AquaStrike 2.5-gallon $ No Bid $
ge | N\uANc] Super Kk 20-pound bag_| § No Bid $
40 | Sonar AS. 10-pound $ No Bid $
41 | Trycera (aguatic use) 2. 5-gallon g No Bid $
42 | Duet-HD Adulticide 30-gallon drum | $ No Bid $
254l {'ug .
43 | Fyfanon EW 2.5-gallon $185.80/ug | s 74.32/gl $70.32/gl for a 30 gl drum
44 | Merus Adulticide 2.5-galon | $No Bid $
45 | ReMoa TRI 30-gallon drum | $8,820.00/dr | §294.00/gl
4 | FalloutLQ 2.5-gallon s No Bid $
47 | Faloutla 30-gallon drum | $ No Bid 3
. 400x25¢g _
48 Sumilarv 0.5G WSP packets/case | §No Bid $
10 x 1kg ‘
49 | Sumilarv 0.5G bags/case | $No Bid $

Name of Bidder: ADAPCO, LLC

(This form to be returned)
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SCHEDULE OF PRICING — CONTINUED

PRODUCT NAME PREFERRED EXCEPTION
UNIT UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE PER
o PACKAGING _GALLON/POUND
Generics - Non-Brand Specificc. =~ .
45 B.T.L. (11% or higher) | 30-galiondrum | $ 161.20/case | $ 32.24/gl Vectobac 12AS Strain AM 65-52
46 B.T.I. {(11% or higher) 2.5-gallon $ 967.20/dr $ 32.24/ql Vectobac 12AS Strain AM 65-52
275-galion iermaSeass 30-30 '
47 | Permanone 30-30 mini-tote $28,817.25/t | §104.79/g! S0 gldram 275 ol dlsate fote.
PermaSease 30-30 .
48 | Permanone 30-30 gallon $ 104.79/g! $ 10479/l 20 gl drim. 575 o slastis tote
49 Deltmethrin gallon ¢ No Bid $
50 2,4-D amine 46% $ No Bid $
(aguatic) 2.5-gallon
51 Copper Algecide- $ No Bid $
Liquid 2.5-gallon
52 Copper Sulfate $ No Bid 3
Pentahydrate 99% 30-gallon
53 Copper Sulfate $ No Bid $
Pentahydrate 99% 50-pound bag
54 Diguat dibromide $ No Bid $
37.3% (aquatic) 2 .5-gallon
55 Fiuridone 41.7% $ No Bid $
(aguatic) 2.5-galion
56 Glyphosate 53.8% $ No Bid $
(aquatic) 2.5-galion
57 Glyphosate 41% $ No Bid $
(terrestrial) 2.5-gallon
58 Hydrogen Peroxide $ No Bid $
Algaecide 15-gallon
59 Triclopyr Amine $ No Bid $
44 4% (aguatic) 2.5-galion
60 | Triclopry Ester 61.6% 15-galion $ No Bid $
81 Spray Indicator Dye 15-gallon $ No Bid $
62 Surfactant, 90% 3 _ #
Nonionic gallon No Bid
90/10 Non-ionic )
63 Spreader/Sticker gallon $ No Bid $
Fyfanon ULV Mosquito $92 12/g! (2x2.5 gl case)| $92.12/g! (2x2.5 gl case)
64 Malathion gallon $ 87.70/g! (55 g drum) | $87.70/g1 (55 gl drum) Fyfanon ULV Mosguito
65 | Cutrine Liquid 2.5-gallon g No Bid $
Name of Bidder: ADAPCO, LLC

{This form to be returned)
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If notified of the acceptance of this bid form, the undersigned agrees to execute a Contract for the stated compensation in the
form as prescribed by the County, within the time constraints outlined in Instructions to Bidders.

The signature below is a guarantee that the Bidder will not withdraw his/her bid for a period of sixty (60) days after the
scheduled time for opening the bids.

In accordance with section 287.135, Florida Statutes, the undersigned certifies that the company is not on the Scrutinized
Companies with Activities in Sudan List, the Scrutinized Companies with Activities in the Iran Petroleum Energy Sector List,
and does not have business operations in Cuba or Syria (if applicable) or the Scrutinized Companies that Boycott Israel List,
or is not participating in a boycott of Israel.

The undersigned acknowledges receipt of the following addenda, and the cost, if any, of such revisions has been included in
the price bid.

Addendum No. NON€ Dateg ;  Addendum No. , Dated ; Addendum No. , Dated

Addendum No. , Dated . Addendum No. , Dated ;  Addendum No. , Dated

HOLD HARMLESS AGREEMENT: The bidding firm as indicated below, through the signing of this document by any
authorized party or agent, indemnify, hold harmless and defend Charlotte County, a political subdivision of the State of
Florida, its officers, agents, employees, and volunteers from all suits and actions, including attorney’s fees and all costs of
litigation and judgment of every name and description brought against the County as a result of loss, damage or injury to
person or property by reason of any act or failure to act by the bidding firm, its agents, servants or employees.

Type of Organization (Please Check One):  Individual Ownership Joint Venture

Partnership Corporation X

Name of Bidding Firm ADAPCO, LLC
100 Colonial Center Parkway, Ste 170, Lake Mary, FL 32746

Mailing Address

Location Address 100 Colonial Center Parkway, Ste 170, Lake Mary, FL 32746

City & State ~ Lake Mary, FL z1p 32746

Telephone: (407) 328-6519 or (800) 367-0659 x6519  g_y4i: @es.vectorbids@azelis.com

Signature of person authorized to bind the Company: T

— T
Print Name/Title of person authorized to bind the Company: W

Date: 11/07/2023

(This form to be returned)
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SCURCE OF SUPPLY AND SUBCONTRACTORS

The foliowing sources of supply and subcontractors shall be used for INSECTICIDES AND HERBICIDES — ANNUAL
CONTRACT. (If quoter does not have a source of supply or subcontractor, insert "to be determined”. When source or
subcontractor is determined, selection will be subject to County approval. If not applicable, please state N/A).

Source of Supply Subcontractor(s)
1 Amguard 1. None
2 Valent Biosciences Corporation 2.
3. Control Solutions 3.
4 FMC Corporation 4
5. 5.
6. 6.

DRUG FREE WORKPLACE FORM

The undersigned vendor in accordance with Florida Statute 287.087 hereby certifies that ADAPCO, LLC
(name of business) does:

1. Publish a statement notifying employees that the uniawful manufacture, distribution, dispensing, possession, or use
of a controlled substance is prohibited in the workplace and specifying the actions that will be taken against employees
for violations of such prohibition.

2. Inform employees about the dangers of drug abuse in the workplace, the business's policy of maintaining a drug-
free workplace, any available drug counseling, rehabilitation, and employee assistance programs, and the penalties that
may be imposed upon employees for drug abuse violations.

3. Give each employee engaged in providing the commaodities or contractual services that are under bid a copy of the
statement specified in subsection (1).

4. In the statement specified in subsection (1), notify the employees that, as a condition of working on the commodities
or coniractual services that are under bid, the employee will abide by the terms of the statement and will notify the
employer of any conviction of, or plea of guilty or nolo contendere to, any violation of Chapter 893 or of any controlled
substance law of the United States or any state, for a violation occurring in the workplace no later than five (5) days
after such conviction.

5. Impose a sanction on, or require the satisfactory participation in a drug abuse assistance or rehabilitation program if
such is available in the employee's community, by any employee who is so convicted.

6. Make a good faith effort to continue to maintain a drug-free workplace through implementation of this section.

As the person authorized to sign the statement, | certify that this firm ggmplﬁs fully wi e above requirements.
Signature =

) Andy Pierce

Dated  11/07/2023
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BYRD ANTI-LOBBYING CERTIFICATION

Certification for Contracts, Grants, Loans, and Cooperative Agreements

The undersigned certifies, to the best of his or her knowledge and belief, that:

(1) No Federal appropriated funds have been paid or will be paid, by or on behalf of the undersigned, to any person for
influencing or attempting to influence an officer or employee of any agency, a Member of Congress, an officer or employee of
Congress, or an employee of a Member of Congress in connection with the awarding of any Federal contract, the making of
an Federal grant, the making of any Federal loan, the entering into of any cooperative agreement, and the extension,
continuation, renewal, amendment, or modification of any Federal contract, grant, loan, or cooperative agreement.

(2) If any funds other than Federal appropriated funds have been paid or will be paid to any person for influencing or
attempting to influence an officer or employee of any agency, a Member of Congress, an officer or employee of Congress, or
an employee of a Member of Congress in connection with this Federal contract, grant, loan, or cooperative agreement, the
undersigned shall complete and submit Standard Form-LLL, “Disclosure Form to Report Lobbying,” in accordance with its
instructions.

(3) The undersigned shall require that the language of this certification be included in the award documents for all subawards
at all tiers (including subcontracts, subgrants, and contracts under grants, loans and cooperative agreements) and that all
subrecipients shall certify and disclose accordingly.

This certification is a material representation of fact upon which reliance was placed when this transaction was made or
entered into. Submission of this certification is a prerequisite for making or entering into this transaction imposed by Section
1352, Title 31, U.S.C. Any person who fails to file the required certification shall be subject to a civil penalty of not less than
$10,000 and not more than $100,000 for each such failure.

11/07/2023 Andy Pierce
Date Type or Print Name
/}/\@\
Signature—
Sr. VP
Title
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IGUARD

ENVIRONMENTAL TECHNOLOGIES

September 12, 2023

Ms. Kathy Russell

Adapco, LLC.

100 Colonial Center Parkway, Suite 170
Lake Mary, FL 32746

Subject: AMVAC Public Health Products Distribution

This letter is to certify that AMVAC CHEMICAL CORPORATION is the sole manufacturer of DIBROM
Concentrate® and TRUMPET® EC insecticides (“AMVAC Products”). ADAPCO is one of the distributors of
the AMVAC Products for public health use. The following outlines the terms for distribution of AMVAC
Products by ADAPCO in the year ending December 31, 2024.

1. ADAPCO is the exclusive distributor of AMVAC Products delivered to the U.S. Military in all 50 United
States.

2. ADAPCO is the exclusive distributor for the AMVAC Products to non-military customers in the following
states and territories:

Alabama Fiorida Nevada Rhode Island
Arizona Georgia New Hampshire South Carolina
Arkansas Louisiana New Jersey Tennessee
California Maine New Mexico Texas

Cayman Islands Maryland New York US Virgin Islands
Connecticut Massachusetis North Carolina Vermont
Delaware Mississippi Pennsylvania Virginia

District of Columbia Missouri Puerto Rico West Virginia

3. ADAPCO is a non-exclusive distributor of the AMVAC Products to non-military customers in the following
states:

Alaska lowa Montana Oregon
Colorado Kansas Nebraska South Dakota
Hawaii Kentucky North Dakota Washington
lllinois Michigan Ohio Wisconsin
Indiana Minnesota Oklahoma

We appreciate your efforts in the 2023 season and look forward to working with you in the coming year.

Sincerely,

Shayne M. Wetherall
CEO, AMGUARD Environmental Technologies

4695 MacArthur Ct., Ste. 1200 Newport Beach, CA 92660 | AMVAC.com | (949) 260-1200



Control
Solutionsinc.

Authorized Distributor Authorization

To whom it may concern:

This communication is to notify customers and vendors, that ADAPCO, LLC an
Azelis Company, located at 100 Colonial Parkway, Suite 170, Lake Mary, FL
32746, is an Authorized Distributor of Control Solutions Mosquito Control
products for the United States in the calendar year of 2024.

If you have any questions or need additional information, please contact me
at:

Scott Pinkerton

Technical Sales Manager

713-213-3310
Scott.pinkerton@controlsolutionsinc.com

Respectfully,
Scott Pinkerton

5903 Genoa Red Bluff  Pasadena, Texas 77507 « USA ¢ www.controlsolutionsinc.com
281-892-2500 ¢ Fax 281-892-2501 « 800-242-5562



W Fyfanon

Insecticides § Sciences Company
2929 Walnut Street
Philadelphia, PA 19104

Date: October 19, 2023

To Whom It May Concern:

This letter affirms that FMC Corporation is the sole manufacturer of the trademarked product
Fyfanon® EW Insecticide for the calendar year 2024. Fyfanon® branded products are sold by FMC
Authorized distributors only.

ADAPCO, an Azelis Company, is the exclusive Authorized distributor for Fyfanon® EW Insecticide
in the United States and its territories. Please contact me with additional information.

Sincerely,

Donald W. Powers

LAl 4

Public Health Market Specialist
Email: Donald. powers@fmec.com
Cell Phone: (205) 299-2954

® FMC and Fyfanon are trademarks of FMC or an affiliate. ©2020 FMC Corporation. All rights reserved.



3IOSCIENCES.

November 1, 2023

ATTN: Jason Trumbetta, ADAPCO LLC
RE: 2024 sole source notification

To Whom It May Concern:

This letter is to advise you that Valent BioSciences, LLC is the sole manufacturer and registrant
of the trademarked product brands VectoBac® (Bacillus thuringiensis subsp. israelenis strain
AM65-52), VectoLex® (Bacillus sphaericus 2362 strain ABTS-1743), VectoMax® (Bacillus
thuringiensis subsp. israelenis strain AM65-52 + Bacillus sphaericus 2362 strain ABTS-
1743), Bactimos® (Bacillus thuringiensis subsp. israelenis strain AM65-52), MetaLarv® and
VectoPrime®. This includes the formulations VectoBac G, VectoBac GS, VectoBac GR,
VectoBac 12AS, VectoBac WDG; VectoLex FG, VectoLex WDG, VectoLex WSP;
VectoMax FG and VectoMax WSP; Bactimos PT, Bactimos WG; MetaLarv S-PT, Metal.arv
XRP; and VectoPrime FG. '

Also, be advised that ADAPCO, LLC is Valent BioSciences LLC's sole authorized distributor
for VectoBac®, VectoLex®, VectoMax®, Bactimos®, VectoPrime® and MetaLarv®
products in the United States, Cayman Islands and Puerto Rico.

Should you have any questions regarding this information, feel free to contact me.

Regards,

Drew Frenter

Drew Hunter | Manager, National Sales - Public Health

1910 Innovation Way [ Libertyville, Illinois 60048
Phone: 503-983-6508
drew.hunter@valentbigsciences.com

www.valentbiosciences.com



November 1, 2023

ATTN: Jason Trumbetta, ADAPCO LLC
RE: 2024 sole source notification

To Whom It May Concern:

This letter is to advise you that Valent BioSciences, LLC is the sole manufacturer and registrant
of the trademarked brand; ReMoa Tri® Triple-Action Adulticide Space Spray.

Also, be advised that ADAPCO, LLC is Valent BioSciences LLC's sole authorized distributor
for products in the United States, Cayman Islands and Puerto Rico.

Should you have any questions regarding this information, feel free to contact me.

Regards,

Drew Hasnter

Drew Hunter | North America Public Health Manager

1910 Innovation Way | Libertyville, Illinois 60048
Phone: 503-983-6508

drew.hunter@valentbiosciences.com

www.valenthiosciences.com



11/13/2023
ADAPCO, LLC
Kathy Russell
(407) 328-6519

DivisioN of

CORPORATIONS

an official State of Florida w

Department of State / Division of Corporations [ Search Records / Search by Entity Name /

Previous On List Mext On List Return to List |adapco

[Search|

Events No Name History

Detail by Entity Name
Florida Limited Liability Company
ADAPCO, LLC

Filing Information

Document Number L16000226827
FEIEIN Number 59-2574523

Date Filed 12/09/2016
Effective Date 03/19/1985

State FL

Status ACTIVE

Last Event LC AMENDMENT
Event Date Filed 06/28/2019
Event Effective Date NONE

Principal Address

100 Colonial Center Parkway
Suite 170
Lake Mary, FL 32746

Changed: 04/06/2022
Mailing Address

100 Colonial Center Parkway
Suite 170
Lake Mary, FL 32745




