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Bid No. 2024000061 

 

TO: Senior Division Manager - Purchasing 
Board of County Commissioners 
Charlotte County Administration Center 
18500 Murdock Circle 
Port Charlotte, Florida 33948-1094 
 

The undersigned, as bidder, does hereby declare that he has read the Request for Bids, Instructions to Bidders, Technical 
Specifications & Conditions, Safety & Health Requirements, Bid Form, and any other documentation for 
 
 INSECTICIDES AND HERBICIDES – ANNUAL CONTRACT 
 
and further agrees to furnish all items listed on the attached Bid Form in accordance with the unit price(s) submitted.  The 
above specified documents are herein incorporated into the Bid Form and shall be defined as the contract documents. 
 
Delivery Time:  72 hours (3 days) from receipt of the order 
 
Please indicate by (√) that you have included the following documentation with your bid: 
 
( ) Material Safety Data Sheets (MSDS) and Labels 
( ) Proof of Authorized Florida Distributor: As per TS-05, All Bidders must provide statement from manufacturer of 

any/all product(s) bid, showing Bidder to be an authorized distributor within the State of Florida for said product.  
 
NOTE: In accordance with Florida Statues, Section 119.071(1)(b)2: Sealed bids, proposals, or replies received by an agency 
pursuant to a competitive solicitation are exempt from s. 119.071(1)(b)2 and s. 24(a), Art. I of the State Constitution, except 
as provided by Florida Statutes 255.0518, until such time as the agency provides notice of an intended decision or until 30 
days after opening the bids, proposals, or final replies, whichever is earlier.  Upon release of the intended decision, if you 
wish to obtain the quote results, you may do so by visiting our Website at http://purchasingbids.charlottecountyfl.gov/ under 
“Purchasing Bids Online”, document number 240614. No information regarding the submittal will be divulged over the 
telephone. 
 
OPTIONAL ELECTRONIC BID SUBMISSIONS: If your firm would like to submit your bid electronically, please visit 
http://bit.ly/3TYAyKa and follow given instructions. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Name of Bidder:              
 (This form to be returned) 

 

BID FORM 
INSECTICIDES AND HERBICIDES – ANNUAL CONTRACT 

BID NO. 2024000061 

Heritage Landscape Supply Group
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SCHEDULE OF PRICING 
 

PRODUCT NAME 
PREFERRED 

UNIT 
PACKAGING 

 
UNIT PRICE 

 
UNIT PRICE PER 
GALLON/POUND 

 
EXCEPTION 

Name Brand Product – No Substitutions: 
 

1 
 
Dibrom Concentrate 

30-gallon drum 
 
$ 

 
$ 

 

 
2 Altosid Briquets – 150 Day 220/case  

 
$ 

 
$ 

 

 
3 

 
Altosid Liquid (5%) 

4 gallons/case 
 
$ 

 
$ 

 

 
4 

 
Altosid Liquid (20%) 

2 x 2.5 
gallon/case 

 
$ 

 
$ 

 

 
5 

 
Altosid Pellets  

 44-pound 
case  

 
$ 

 
$ 

 

 
6 

 
Zenivex   

120-gallon 
mini-tote 

 
$ 

 
$ 

 

 
7 

 
Captain XTR 

2.5-gallon 
 
$ 

 
$ 

 

 
8 

 
Reward 

2.5-gallon 
 
$ 

 
$ 

 

 
9 

Cutrine®-Plus Algecide-
Granular  

 30-pound bag  
 
$ 

 
$ 

 

 
10 

 
Deltagard  gallon 

 
$ 

 
$ 

 

 
11 

 
Sonar SRP  40-pound pail 

 
$ 

 
$ 

 

 
12 

 
Avast  gallon  

 
$ 

 
$ 

 

 
13 

 
Trycera (aquatic use)  gallon  

 
$ 

 
$ 

 

 
14 

 
Garlon 4  gallon  

 
$ 

 
$ 

 

 
15 

 
Diquat SPC  gallon  

 
$ 

 
$ 

 

 
16 

 
Natular G30  

40-pound bag 
 
$ 

 
$ 

 

 
17 

 
Natular XRT  

220 tablet/ 
case 

 
$ 

 
$ 

 

 
18 

Central Life Sciences Duplex-G 
Larvicide  

40-pound bag 
 
$ 

 
$ 

 

 
19 

 
Duet - Adulticide  

30-gallon drum 
 
$ 

 
$ 

 

 
20 

 
Fourstar  

35-pound bag 
 
$ 

 
$ 

 

 
21 

 
Metalarve-Larvicide-Granular  

pound 
 
$ 

 
$ 

 

 
22 

 
Top Film-Adjuvant  

2.5-gallon 
 
$ 

 
$ 

 

 
23 

 
Duplex-G Larvicide 

40-pound bag 
 
$ 

 
$ 

 

 
 24 

 
Vectobac-AS 

2.5-gallon 
 
$ 

 
$ 

 

 
25 

 
Vectobac-AS 

30-gallon drum 
 
$ 

 
$ 

 

 
Name of Bidder:              
 (This form to be returned) 

83.72

240.00

70.43

1,553.60

1,994.84

130.84

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

130.84

1,994.84

1,553.60

70.43

240.00

83.72
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SCHEDULE OF PRICING – CONTINUED 
 

PRODUCT NAME 
PREFERRED 

UNIT 
PACKAGING 

 
UNIT PRICE 

 
UNIT PRICE PER 
GALLON/POUND 

 
EXCEPTION 

 
26 

 
Vectoprime FG pound 

 
$ 

 
$ 

 

 
27 

 
Vectobac GS 40-pound bag 

 
$ 

 
$ 

 

 
28 

 
Vectomax FG 40-pound bag 

 
$ 

 
$ 

 

 
29 

 
Vectrobac GR 40-pound bag 

 
$ 

 
$ 

 
 

   
 

30 
 
Zenivex E20 

 275-gallon 
mini-tote  

 
$ $ 

 

 
31 

 
Tribune  gallon  

 
$ 

 
$ 

 

 
32 

 
Rodeo 

275-gallon 
mini-tote 

 
$ 

 
$ 

 

 
33 

 
Basil Oil gallon 

 
$ 

 
$ 

 

 
34 

 
Greenclean-Pro  50-pound bag 

 
$ 

 
$ 

 

 
35 

 
Alligare Triclopyr4  gallon 

 
$ 

 
$ 

 

 
36 

 
Kontrol 30/30  

275-gallon 
mini-tote 

 
$ 

 
$ 

 

 
37 

 
Vectomax WSP  2.5-gallon  $ 

 

 
38 

 
AquaStrike  2.5-gallon 

 
$ 

 
$ 

 

 
39 

Aquathol Super K 
20-pound bag 

 
$ 

 
$ 

 

 
40 

 
Sonar A.S.  10-pound 

 
$ 

 
$ 

 

 
41 

 
Trycera  (aquatic use)  2.5-gallon 

 
$ 

 
$ 

 

 
42 

 
Duet-HD Adulticide 30-gallon drum 

 
$ 

 
$ 

 

 
43 

 
Fyfanon EW 2.5-gallon 

 
$ 

 
$ 

 

 
44 

 
Merus Adulticide 2.5-gallon 

 
$ 

 
$ 

 

 
45 

ReMoa TRI  
30-gallon drum 

 
$ 

 
$ 

 

 
46 

Fallout LQ 
2.5-gallon 

 
$ 

 
$ 

 

 
47 

Fallout LQ 
30-gallon drum 

 
$ 

 
$ 

 

 
48 

Sumilarv 0.5G WSP 
400x25g 

packets/case 
 
$ 

 
$ 

 

 
49 

 
Sumilarv 0.5G 

10 x 1kg 
bags/case 

 
$ 

 
$ 

 

 
 
 
 
Name of Bidder:              
 (This form to be returned) 

Type text here

63.58

191.87

430.00

Heritage Landscape Supply Group

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

63.58

191.87

430.00
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SCHEDULE OF PRICING – CONTINUED 
PRODUCT NAME PREFERRED 

UNIT 
PACKAGING 

 
UNIT PRICE 

 
UNIT PRICE PER 
GALLON/POUND 

EXCEPTION 

Generics - Non-Brand Specific: 
 

45 
 
B.T.I. (11% or higher) 30-gallon drum 

 
$ 

 
$ 

 

 
46 

 
B.T.I. (11% or higher) 2.5-gallon 

 
$ 

 
$ 

 

 
47 

 
Permanone 30-30 

275-gallon  
mini-tote 

 
$ 

 
$ 

 

 
48 

 
Permanone 30-30 gallon 

 
$ 

 
$ 

 

 
49 

 
Deltmethrin gallon 

 
$ 

 
$ 

 

 
50 

 
2,4-D amine 46% 
(aquatic)  2.5-gallon 

 
$ 

 
$ 

 

 
51 

 
Copper Algecide-
Liquid 2.5-gallon 

 
$ 

 
$ 

 

 
52 

 
Copper Sulfate 
Pentahydrate 99%  30-gallon 

 
$ 

 
$ 

 

 
53 

 
Copper Sulfate 
Pentahydrate 99%  50-pound bag 

 
$ 

 
$ 

 

 
54 

 
Diquat dibromide 
37.3% (aquatic)  2.5-gallon 

 
$ 

 
$ 

 

 
55 

 
Fluridone 41.7% 
(aquatic)   2.5-gallon  

 
$ 

 
$ 

 

 
56 

 
Glyphosate 53.8% 
(aquatic)   2.5-gallon  

 
$ 

 
$ 

 

 
57 

 
Glyphosate 41% 
(terrestrial)   2.5-gallon  

 
$ 

 
$ 

 

 
58 

 
Hydrogen Peroxide 
Algaecide   15-gallon  

 
$ 

 
$ 

 

 
59 

 
Triclopyr Amine 
44.4% (aquatic)   2.5-gallon  

 
$ 

 
$ 

 

 
60 

 
Triclopry Ester 61.6%  15-gallon 

 
$ 

 
$ 

 

 
61 

 
Spray Indicator Dye  15-gallon 

 
$ 

 
$ 

 

 
62 

 
Surfactant, 90% 
Nonionic   gallon  

 
$ 

 
# 

 

 
63 

90/10 Non-ionic 
Spreader/Sticker gallon 

 
$ 

 
$ 

 

 
64 

 
Malathion gallon 

 
$ 

 
$ 

 

 
65 

 
Cutrine Liquid 2.5-gallon 

 
$ 

 
$ 

 

 
Name of Bidder:              
 (This form to be returned)

Heritage Landscape Supply Group

52.98

110.86

68.45

58.69 2.5 Gallon Jug

3,695.65 1 Gallon Jug

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

56.69

68.45

3,695.65

52.98

110.86
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If notified of the acceptance of this bid form, the undersigned agrees to execute a Contract for the stated compensation in the 
form as prescribed by the County, within the time constraints outlined in Instructions to Bidders. 
 
The signature below is a guarantee that the Bidder will not withdraw his/her bid for a period of sixty (60) days after the 
scheduled time for opening the bids. 
 
In accordance with section 287.135, Florida Statutes, the undersigned certifies that the company is not on the Scrutinized 
Companies with Activities in Sudan List, the Scrutinized Companies with Activities in the Iran Petroleum Energy Sector List, 
and does not have business operations in Cuba or Syria (if applicable) or the Scrutinized Companies that Boycott Israel List, 
or is not participating in a boycott of Israel. 
 
The undersigned acknowledges receipt of the following addenda, and the cost, if any, of such revisions has been included in 
the price bid. 
 
Addendum No.           , Dated           ; Addendum No.           , Dated             ; Addendum No.          , Dated      
 
Addendum No.           , Dated           ; Addendum No.           , Dated             ; Addendum No.          , Dated      
 
HOLD HARMLESS AGREEMENT: The bidding firm as indicated below, through the signing of this document by any 
authorized party or agent, indemnify, hold harmless and defend Charlotte County, a political subdivision of the State of 
Florida, its officers, agents, employees, and volunteers from all suits and actions, including attorney’s fees and all costs of 
litigation and judgment of every name and description brought against the County as a result of loss, damage or injury to 
person or property by reason of any act or failure to act by the bidding firm, its agents, servants or employees.   
 
Type of Organization (Please Check One): Individual Ownership              Joint Venture   
 
                                                                               Partnership               Corporation    
 
 Name of Bidding Firm              
 
Mailing Address              
 
Location Address              
 
City & State             ZIP    
 
Telephone:        E-mail:        
 
Signature of person authorized to bind the Company:           
 
Print Name/Title of person authorized to bind the Company:          
 

  Date:             
 

 
 
 

(This form to be returned) 

Heritage Landscape Supply Group

7440 State Highway 121

7440 State Highway 121

McKinney, Texas 75070

207-606-9119 JB102118@mmhfgb.com

Jeff Baker Bid Development Manager

11/15/2023
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SOURCE OF SUPPLY AND SUBCONTRACTORS 
 
The following sources of supply and subcontractors shall be used for INSECTICIDES AND HERBICIDES – ANNUAL 
CONTRACT.  (If quoter does not have a source of supply or subcontractor, insert "to be determined".  When source or 
subcontractor is determined, selection will be subject to County approval.  If not applicable, please state N/A). 
 

Source of Supply     Subcontractor(s) 
 
1.       1.     
 
2.       2.     
 
3.        3.     
 
4.        4.     
 
5.        5.     
 
6.        6.     
 

 
 

DRUG FREE WORKPLACE FORM 
 
The undersigned vendor in accordance with Florida Statute 287.087 hereby certifies that      
(name of business) does: 
 
1. Publish a statement notifying employees that the unlawful manufacture, distribution, dispensing, possession, or use 
of a controlled substance is prohibited in the workplace and specifying the actions that will be taken against employees 
for violations of such prohibition. 
 
2. Inform employees about the dangers of drug abuse in the workplace, the business's policy of maintaining a drug-
free workplace, any available drug counseling, rehabilitation, and employee assistance programs, and the penalties that 
may be imposed upon employees for drug abuse violations. 
 
3. Give each employee engaged in providing the commodities or contractual services that are under bid a copy of the 
statement specified in subsection (1). 
 
4. In the statement specified in subsection (1), notify the employees that, as a condition of working on the commodities 
or contractual services that are under bid, the employee will abide by the terms of the statement and will notify the 
employer of any conviction of, or plea of guilty or nolo contendere to, any violation of Chapter 893 or of any controlled 
substance law of the United States or any state, for a violation occurring in the workplace no later than five (5) days 
after such conviction. 
 
5. Impose a sanction on, or require the satisfactory participation in a drug abuse assistance or rehabilitation program if 
such is available in the employee's community, by any employee who is so convicted. 
 
6. Make a good faith effort to continue to maintain a drug-free workplace through implementation of this section. 

 
As the person authorized to sign the statement, I certify that this firm complies fully with the above requirements. 
       
      Signature         
 
      Dated            

Heritage Landscape Supply Group

11/15/2023

N/A N/A
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BYRD ANTI-LOBBYING CERTIFICATION 
 

Certification for Contracts, Grants, Loans, and Cooperative Agreements 
 
The undersigned certifies, to the best of his or her knowledge and belief, that: 
 
(1)  No Federal appropriated funds have been paid or will be paid, by or on behalf of the undersigned, to any person for 
influencing or attempting to influence an officer or employee of any agency, a Member of Congress, an officer or employee of 
Congress, or an employee of a Member of Congress in connection with the awarding of any Federal contract, the making of 
an Federal grant, the making of any Federal loan, the entering into of any cooperative agreement, and the extension, 
continuation, renewal, amendment, or modification of any Federal contract, grant, loan, or cooperative agreement. 
 
(2)  If any funds other than Federal appropriated funds have been paid or will be paid to any person for influencing or 
attempting to influence an officer or employee of any agency, a Member of Congress, an officer or employee of Congress, or 
an employee of a Member of Congress in connection with this Federal contract, grant, loan, or cooperative agreement, the 
undersigned shall complete and submit Standard Form-LLL, “Disclosure Form to Report Lobbying,” in accordance with its 
instructions. 
 
(3)  The undersigned shall require that the language of this certification be included in the award documents for all subawards 
at all tiers (including subcontracts, subgrants, and contracts under grants, loans and cooperative agreements) and that all 
subrecipients shall certify and disclose accordingly. 
 
This certification is a material representation of fact upon which reliance was placed when this transaction was made or 
entered into.  Submission of this certification is a prerequisite for making or entering into this transaction imposed by Section 
1352, Title 31, U.S.C.  Any person who fails to file the required certification shall be subject to a civil penalty of not less than 
$10,000 and not more than $100,000 for each such failure. 
 
 
 
____________________________   ________________________________ 
Date       Type or Print Name 
 
 
 
       ________________________________ 
       Signature 
 
 
 
         ________________________________ 
       Title 
 
 
 

Jeff Baker

Bid Development Manager

11/15/2023


