BID FORM
INSECTICIDES AND HERBICIDES — ANNUAL CONTRACT
BID NO. 2024000061

TO: Senior Division Manager - Purchasing
Board of County Commissioners
Charlotte County Administration Center
18500 Murdock Circle
Port Charlotte, Florida 33948-1094

The undersigned, as bidder, does hereby declare that he has read the Request for Bids, Instructions to Bidders, Technical
Specifications & Conditions, Safety & Health Requirements, Bid Form, and any other documentation for

INSECTICIDES AND HERBICIDES — ANNUAL CONTRACT

and further agrees to furnish all items listed on the attached Bid Form in accordance with the unit price(s) submitted. The
above specified documents are herein incorporated into the Bid Form and shall be defined as the contract documents.

Delivery Time: 72 hours (3 days) from receipt of the order
Please indicate by (V) that you have included the following documentation with your bid:

(X) Material Safety Data Sheets (MSDS) and Labels
(x ) Proof of Authorized Florida Distributor: As per TS-05, All Bidders must provide statement from manufacturer of
any/all product(s) bid, showing Bidder to be an authorized distributor within the State of Florida for said product.

NOTE: In accordance with Florida Statues, Section 119.071(1)(b)2: Sealed bids, proposals, or replies received by an agency
pursuant to a competitive solicitation are exempt from s. 119.071(1)(b)2 and s. 24(a), Art. | of the State Constitution, except
as provided by Florida Statutes 255.0518, until such time as the agency provides notice of an intended decision or until 30
days after opening the bids, proposals, or final replies, whichever is earlier. Upon release of the intended decision, if you
wish to obtain the quote results, you may do so by visiting our Website at http://purchasingbids.charlottecountyfl.gov/ under
“Purchasing Bids Online”, document number 240614. No information regarding the submittal will be divulged over the

telephone.

OPTIONAL ELECTRONIC BID SUBMISSIONS: If your firm would like to submit your bid electronically, please visit
http://bit.ly/3TYAyKa and follow given instructions.

Name of Bidder: SiteOne Landscape Supply
(This form to be returned)
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SCHEDULE OF PRICING

PREFERRED
PRODUCT NAME UNIT PRICE (L;NIT PRICE PER EXCEPTION
1 | Dibrom Concentrate 30-gallon drum | ¢ No Bid $
o | Altosid Briquets — 150 Day 220/case $No Bid $
3 | Altosid Liquid (5%) 4 gallons/case | ¢ 5260 per160z | g 420.80 16 oz bottle
4 | Altosid Liquid (20%) gaﬁoxn?c;gse $No Bid $
44-pound
5 | Altosid Pellets case $ No Bid $
120-gallon
6 | Zenivex mini-tote $No Bid $
7| Captain XTR 2.5-gallon | ¢ No Bid $
8 | Reward 2.5-gallon $240.00 $ 96.00
9 8?223?5?43'% Hlgecide 30-pound bag | 492 25 g 3.075
10 | Deltagard gallon $No Bid $
11_| Sonar SRP 40-pound pail | $No Bid $
12 | Avast galion $2,638.82 |g 2,638.82
13 | Trycera (aquatic use) gallon ¢ No Bid $
14 | Garlon 4 galion $2502825gal | g 100.11 2.5 gallon jug
15_| Diquat SPC gallon $110.70 $ 110.70
16_| Natular G30 40-pound bag | ¢No Bid $
220 tablet/
17_| Natular XRT _ case $No Bid $
8 Eaerr\]/ti::?éllélfe Sciences Duplex-G 40-pound bag sNo Bid .
19 | Duet - Adulticide 30-gallon drum | ¢ No Bid $
20 | Fourstar 35-pound bag | ¢ No Bid $
21 | Metalarve-Larvicide-Granular Reund $ No Bid $
22 | Top Film-Adjuvant 2.5-gallon | «No Bid $
23 | Duplex-G Larvicide 40-pound bag | s No Bid $
24 | Vectobac-AS 2.5-gallon | ¢ No Bid $
25 | Vectobac-AS 30-gallon drum | ¢ Ng bid $

Name of Bidder: SiteOne Landscape Supply

(This form to be returned)
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SCHEDULE OF PRICING — CONTINUED

PREFERRED
PRODUCT NAME UNIT UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE PER EXCEPTION
PACKAGING GALLON/POUND
26 | Vectoprime FG pound $ No Bid $
27 | Vectobac GS 40-pound bag | $No Bid $
28 | Vectomax FG 40-pound bag | $No Bid $
29 | Vectrobac GR 40-pound bag | $ ) $
No Bid
275-gallon .
30 | Zenivex E20 mini-tote $No Bid $
31 | Tribune gallon $76.25 $ 76.25
275-gallon )
32 | Rodeo mini-tote ¢ No Bid $
33 | Basil Oll gallon ¢ No Bid $
34 | Greenclean-Pro 50-pound bag | $ No Bid $
35 | Alligare Triclopyr4 gallon $No Bid $
275-gallon .
36 | Kontrol 30/30 mini-tote $No Bid $
37 | Vectomax WSP 25-gallon | No Bid
38 | AquaStrike 2.5-gallon g No Bid $
39 Aquathol Super K 20-pound bag | $323.16 per 10l § 32 32 10lb bag
40 | SonarA.S. 10-pound $No Bid $
41 | Trycera (aquatic use) 2.5-gallon ¢$No Bid $
42 | Duet-HD Adulticide 30-gallon drum | $ No Bid $
43 | Fyfanon EW 2.5-gallon $No Bid $
44 | Merus Adulticide 2.5-gallon | $No Bid $
45 | ReMoaTRI 30-gallon drum | $No Bid $
46 | FalloutlQ 2 5-gallon | $No Bid $
47 Fallout LQ 30-gallon drum | $§ No Bid $
. 400x25g .
48 Sumilarv 0.5G WSP packets/case $ No Bid $
10 x 1kg .
49 | Sumilarv 0.5G bags/case $No Bid $

Name of Bidder: SiteOne Landscape Supply
(This form to be returned)
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SCHEDULE OF PRICING — CONTINUED

PRODUCT NAME

SPACK,

PREFERRED
UNIT

NG

UNIT PRICE

UNIT PRICE PER

EXCEPTION

45 | B.T.I. (11% or higher) | 30-gallon drum | $No Bid $
46 | B.T... (11% or higher) 2.5-gallon ¢ No Bid $
275-gallon i

47 | Permanone 30-30 mini-tote $5,892.21 55gal| ¢ 107.131 Permethrin SFR 55 gal
48 | Permanone 30-30 gallon $89.73 $ 89.73 Permethrin SFR 1 gal
49 Deltmethrin gallon $No Bid $
50 | 2,4-D amine 46% $ . $

(aquatic) 2.5-gallon No Bid
51 Copper Algecide- $ $

Liqﬁ% 9 2.5-gallon 30.75 1gal 30.75 Argos 9% Copper Algaecide? gal
52 Copper Sulfate $ _ $

Pentahydrate 99% 30-gallon No Bid
53 Copper Sulfate $ $

Per?tizhydrate 99% 50-pound bag 179.72 3.594 Copper Sulfate Crystals Algecide 50Ib
54 Diquat dibromide $ $ . )

37.3% (aquatic) 2.5-gallon 184.38 73.752 Tribune Diquat 2.5 gal
55 Fluridone 41.7% $ $ . .

(aquatic) ° 2 5-gallon 2,638.81 1gal 2,638.81 Avast Aquaticd Fluridone 1 gal

RoundUp Custom

56 | Glyphosate 53.8% $ $ :

(aquatic) 2.5-gallon 80.50 322 Non Selective 2.5 gal
57 Glyphosate 41% 3

tomestrial) 25.qallon | 47.88 19.152 LESCO Prosecutor Pro 2.5 gal
58 Hydrogen Peroxide $

Aléaegide erox 15-gallon ¥ 111.76 2.5 gal 44.704 Zerotol 2.0 2.5 gal
59 | Triclopyr Amine $ . $

44.4% (aquatic) 2.5-gallon No Bid

LESCO Triclopyr 4

60 | Triclopry Ester 61.6% |  15-gallon | $2.282.3330gal g 76.077 Ester 30 gal
61 | Spray Indicator Dye 15-gallon $601.3330gal |5 20.044 LESCO Tracker Blue 30 gal
62 Surfactant, 90% $ #

Nonionic gallon

90/10 Non-ionic
63 Spreader/Sticker ga”on $ 21.42 $ 21.42 LESCO 90/10 Nonionic
64 | Malathion gallon $ No Bid $
65 | Cutrine Liquid 2.5-gallon $89.65 $ 89.65

Name of Bidder: SiteOne Landscape Supply
(This form to be returned)
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If notified of the acceptance of this bid form, the undersigned agrees to execute a Contract for the stated compensation in the
form as prescribed by the County, within the time constraints outlined in Instructions to Bidders.

The signature below is a guarantee that the Bidder will not withdraw his/her bid for a period of sixty (60) days after the
scheduled time for opening the bids.

In accordance with section 287.135, Florida Statutes, the undersigned certifies that the company is not on the Scrutinized
Companies with Activities in Sudan List, the Scrutinized Companies with Activities in the Iran Petroleum Energy Sector List,
and does not have business operations in Cuba or Syria (if applicable) or the Scrutinized Companies that Boycott Israel List,
or is not participating in a boycott of Israel.

The undersigned acknowledges receipt of the following addenda, and the cost, if any, of such revisions has been included in
the price bid.

Addendum No. , Dated ; Addendum No. , Dated : Addendum No. , Dated

Addendum No. , Dated : Addendum No. , Dated : Addendum No. , Dated

HOLD HARMLESS AGREEMENT: The bidding firm as indicated below, through the signing of this document by any
authorized party or agent, indemnify, hold harmless and defend Charlotte County, a political subdivision of the State of
Florida, its officers, agents, employees, and volunteers from all suits and actions, including attorney’s fees and all costs of
litigation and judgment of every name and description brought against the County as a result of loss, damage or injury to
person or property by reason of any act or failure to act by the bidding firm, its agents, servants or employees.

Type of Organization (Please Check One):  Individual Ownership ______ Joint Venture
Partnership _____ Corporation X
Name of Bidding Firm SiteOne Landscape Supply
Mailing Address 1385 East 36th St Cleveland OH 44114
Location Address 1464 Market Cir
City & State _Port Charlotte, FL zip 33953
Telephone: 216.706.9250 E-mail: bids@siteone.com
Signature of person authorized to bind the Company: =

Print Name/Title of person authorized to bind the Company: Keith O. McGinty

(This form to be returned)
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SOURCE OF SUPPLY AND SUBCONTRACTORS

The following sources of supply and subcontractors shall be used for INSECTICIDES AND HERBICIDES — ANNUAL
CONTRACT. (If quoter does not have a source of supply or subcontractor, insert "to be determined". When source or
subcontractor is determined, selection will be subject to County approval. If not applicable, please state N/A).

Source of Supply Subcontractor(s)
1. SiteOne Landscape Supply will purchase all 1. N/A
2 chemicals on this bid directly from the manufacturers | 2
3. 3.
4. 4
5 5.
6. 6

DRUG FREE WORKPLACE FORM

The undersigned vendor in accordance with Florida Statute 287.087 hereby certifies that SiteOne Landscape Supply
(name of business) does:

1. Publish a statement notifying employees that the unlawful manufacture, distribution, dispensing, possession, or use
of a controlled substance is prohibited in the workplace and specifying the actions that will be taken against employees
for violations of such prohibition.

2. Inform employees about the dangers of drug abuse in the workplace, the business's policy of maintaining a drug-
free workplace, any available drug counseling, rehabilitation, and employee assistance programs, and the penalties that
may be imposed upon employees for drug abuse violations.

3. Give each employee engaged in providing the commodities or contractual services that are under bid a copy of the
statement specified in subsection (1).

4. In the statement specified in subsection (1), notify the employees that, as a condition of working on the commodities
or contractual services that are under bid, the employee will abide by the terms of the statement and will notify the
employer of any conviction of, or plea of guilty or nolo contendere to, any violation of Chapter 893 or of any controlled
substance law of the United States or any state, for a violation occurring in the workplace no later than five (5) days
after such conviction.

5. Impose a sanction on, or require the satisfactory participation in a drug abuse assistance or rehabilitation program if
such is available in the employee's community, by any employee who is so convicted.

6. Make a good faith effort to continue to maintain a drug-free workplace through implementation of this section.

As the person authorized to sign the statement, | certify that this firm complies fully with the above requirements.

11/3/23 e

Signature

Dated
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BYRD ANTI-LOBBYING CERTIFICATION

Certification for Contracts, Grants, Loans, and Cooperative Agreements

The undersigned certifies, to the best of his or her knowledge and belief, that:

(1) No Federal appropriated funds have been paid or will be paid, by or on behalf of the undersigned, to any person for
influencing or attempting to influence an officer or employee of any agency, a Member of Congress, an officer or employee of
Congress, or an employee of a Member of Congress in connection with the awarding of any Federal contract, the making of
an Federal grant, the making of any Federal loan, the entering into of any cooperative agreement, and the extension,
continuation, renewal, amendment, or modification of any Federal contract, grant, loan, or cooperative agreement.

(2) If any funds other than Federal appropriated funds have been paid or will be paid to any person for influencing or
attempting to influence an officer or employee of any agency, a Member of Congress, an officer or employee of Congress, or
an employee of a Member of Congress in connection with this Federal contract, grant, loan, or cooperative agreement, the
undersigned shall complete and submit Standard Form-LLL, “Disclosure Form to Report Lobbying,” in accordance with its
instructions.

(3) The undersigned shall require that the language of this certification be included in the award documents for all subawards
at all tiers (including subcontracts, subgrants, and contracts under grants, loans and cooperative agreements) and that all
subrecipients shall certify and disclose accordingly.

This certification is a material representation of fact upon which reliance was placed when this transaction was made or
entered into. Submission of this certification is a prerequisite for making or entering into this transaction imposed by Section
1352, Title 31, U.S.C. Any person who fails to file the required certification shall be subject to a civil penalty of not less than
$10,000 and not more than $100,000 for each such failure.

11/3/23 Keith O. McGinty
Date Type or Print Name

Sjgr(af %

Director
Title
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November 6, 2023

Alligare

A member of the ADAMA Group

To Whom it May Concern:

Alligare, LLC

1565 5™ Avenue
Opelika, AL 36801
334-741-9393
ALLIGARE.COM

This letter is to confirm that SiteOne Landscaping Supply is a good standing and authorized
dealer of Alligare products.

If you have any questions, please reach out to myself. My contact info is below.

Sincerely,

Paul Conti
Territory Manager

Paul.Conti@Alligare.com

610-742-6303

P.O. Box 967 | Opelika, AL 36803 | 1565 5th Avenue | Opelika, AL 36801
888-ALLIGARE | 334-741-9393 | FAX 334-741-9395 | WWW.ALLIGARE.COM



Brandt Consolidated Inc Tel 2175475800
2935 South Koke Mill Road Fax 217 547 5899 er

Springfield IL 6271 USA www.brandt.co

November 8, 2023

To whom it may concern:

This letter is to confirm that SiteOne Landscape Supply is an authorized distributor of
Brandt, Grigg and Brandt iHammer products produced by Brandt Consolidated, Inc.
headquartered in Springfield, IL.

If you have any questions, please contact Kym Wood, Business Development Manager for
Brandt at (321-228-4480) or Kym.Wood@Brandt.co or me.

Sincerely,

John Guglielmi

National Sales Director
U.S. and Canada

Brandt Consolidated, Inc.
(407-448-1393) cell
John.Guglielmi@Brandt.co




1-BASF

We create chemistry Professional & Specialty Solutions

November 3, 2023

Siteone Landscape Supply
Attn: Kevin Laycock

300 Colonial Center Parkway
Suite 600

Roswell, GA 30076

Re: BASF Corporation Certification

Dear Mr. Laycock:

This letter certifies that Siteone Landscape Supply is currently an authorized
agent and distributor of BASF’s Pest Control, Turf and Ornamental products for the
United States. This is effective for the 2023 and 2024 calendar year.

Sincerely,

BASF CORPORATION

By:
Name: Trey Warnock

Title: Strateqgic Account Manager

BASF Corporation

26 Davis Drive

PO Box 13528

Research Triangle Park, NC 27709-3528



To Whom it May Concern:

Bayer CropScience LP
800 N Lindbergh Blvd
St. Louis, MO 63167

November 8, 2023

SiteOne Landscape Supply, Corporate Headquarters: 300 Colonial Center Parkway. Suite 600, Roswell, GA
30076 is an authorized distributor for Bayer’s Industrial, Turf and Ornamental Herbicides in the United States

As an authorized distributor, their employees are trained on proper product stewardship and their facilities are
inspected to be sure they comply with all product safety and security requirements.

Bayer’s Industrial Turf and Ornamental products include:

e Ranger Pro® Herbicide EPA Registration number

e  Roundup ProConcentrate® EPA Registration number

e  Roundup ProMax® EPA Registration number

e  Roundup Custom® ATU EPA Registration number

e  Roundup QuikPro® EPA Registration number
Sincerely:

7203l o

Michael Owen
IT&O Commercial Lead

524-517
524-529
524-579
524-343
524-535



22 Meadow Street

Blo Safé East Hartford, CT 06108
? Phone: 860.290.8890
Systems Fax: 860.290.8802

www.biosafesystems.com
November 8, 2023

To Whom it May Concern:

This letter is to confirm that SiteOne is an authorized distributor of BioSafe Systems products in
good standing

If you have any questions, please contact:

Eric Smith

National Sales Manager

Horticulture Division

(561) 955-0315

Sincerely,

Jesse Allen

Simply Sustainable. Always Effective.



@ CORTEVA

agriscience Corteva Agriscience
9330 Zionsville Road
Indianapolis, IN 46278

November 9, 2023

To Whom It May Concern,

This letter is to confirm that SiteOne Landscape Supply is an authorized distributor of Corteva Agriscience
in good standing.

If you have any questions, please contact me.

Regards,

) /
A/
A

Nick Browne

Sales Leader
Corteva Agriscience
616-916-0616

corteva.com @ecorteva



[ ESCO

January 1, 2023
To Whom It May Concern:

SiteOne Landscape Supply is the exclusive distributor for all LESCO branded products nationwide and is
in good standing.

If you have questions, please feel free to call me at 800.321.5325.
Sincerely,

Vivianna Torres
Asst Regulatory Manager



N\ Nufarm

11901 South Austin Avenue
Alsip, Il. 60803

Phone: (708) 377-1330

nufarm.com

November 6, 2023

Mike Caprio

Key Account Manager

US Turf & Ornamental

10962 Legacy Gateway Circle
Unit 220

Fort Myers, Florida 33913

To whom it may concern,

Please use this document as certification that SiteOne Landscape Supply is an authorized distributor for
Nufarm products.

Please feel free to reach out with any additional questions.

Yours sincerely,
Mike Caprio

Mike Caprio

Key Account Manager

M: (732) 978-0409

E: mike.caprio@nufarm.com

© 2018 Nufarm Limited



SelPRO

SePRO Corporation ¢ 11550 North Meridian Street e Suite 600 ¢ Carmel, Indiana 46032-4565
Phone: (317) 580-8282 e Fax: (317) 580-8290

To Whom It May Concern,

This communication is to confirm that SiteOne is an authorized Distributor of SePRO
Corporation.

Please reach out with any specific questions.

=

John Wendorf

Director- SePRO Turf & Ornamentals
SePRO Corporation
johnw(@sepro.com

(919) 306-5595

CONFIDENTIAL AGREEMENT - NOT FOR REPRODUCTION OR DISTRIBUTION



Dave Ravel Tel: 336-509-1972 Syngenta Professional Solutions
Head of Sales North America Dave.Ravel 4802 Worchester Place
@syngenta.com Jamestown, NC 27282
www.syngenta.com

g
syngenta

Charlotte County Purchasing Division
18500 Murdock Circle, Suite 344
Port Charlotte, Florida 33948-1094

November 8, 2023

Syngenta Authorized Channel Partner; SiteOne Landscape Supply

To Kathy Lindback,

This is to confirm that SiteOne Landscape Supply is an authorized
distributor and agent for the Syngenta Professional Solutions product line.

If you have any further questions, please feel free to contact me at 336-509-
1972.

Sincerely,
232

Dave Ravel
Head of Sales, North America
Syngenta Professional Solutions



UPL NA Inc.

630 Freedom Business Center
Suite 402

King of Prussia, PA 19406

w: upl-ltd.com
e: Steve.Fasano@upl-itd.com
t: +1 267 400 2436

November 7, 2023
To Whom it may concern,

This letter is to confirm that SiteOne Landscape Supply is an authorized distributor of UPL
Environmental Solutions Products in good standing.

If you have any questions, please contact:

Joe Grippi

UPL Environmental Solutions Key Account Manager
Key Account Manager

+1 984-800-6124

Steve Fasano
Head of Environmental Solutions

UPL NA, In¢

630 Freedom Business Center
Suite 402

King of Prussia, PA 19406

t: +1 267 400 2436

e: steve.fasano@upl-Itd.com



