BID FORM
INSECTICIDES AND HERBICIDES — ANNUAL CONTRACT
BID NO. 2024000061

TO: Senior Division Manager - Purchasing
Board of County Commissioners
Charlotte County Administration Center
18500 Murdock Circle
Port Charlotte, Florida 33948-1094

The undersigned, as bidder, does hereby declare that he has read the Request for Bids, Instructions to Bidders, Technical
Specifications & Conditions, Safety & Health Requirements, Bid Form, and any other documentation for

INSECTICIDES AND HERBICIDES — ANNUAL CONTRACT

and further agrees to furnish all items listed on the attached Bid Form in accordance with the unit price(s) submitted. The
above specified documents are herein incorporated into the Bid Form and shall be defined as the contract documents.

Delivery Time: 72 hours (3 days) from receipt of the order
Please indicate by (V) that you have included the following documentation with your bid:

(v ) Material Safety Data Sheets (MSDS) and Labels
(v ) Proof of Authorized Florida Distributor: As per TS-05, All Bidders must provide statement from manufacturer of
any/all product(s) bid, showing Bidder to be an authorized distributor within the State of Florida for said product.

NOTE: In accordance with Florida Statues, Section 119.071(1)(b)2: Sealed bids, proposals, or replies received by an agency
pursuant to a competitive solicitation are exempt from s. 119.071(1)b)2 and s. 24(a), Art. | of the State Constitution, except
as provided by Florida Statutes 255.0518, until such time as the agency provides notice of an intended decision or until 30
days after opening the bids, proposals, or final replies, whichever is earlier. Upon release of the intended decision, if you
wish to obtain the quote results, you may do so by visiting our Website at http://purchasingbids.charlottecountyfl.qov/ under
“Purchasing Bids Online”, document number 240614. No information regarding the submittal will be divulged over the
telephone.

OPTIONAL ELECTRONIC BID SUBMISSIONS: If your firm would like to submit your bid electronically, please visit
http://bit.ly/3TYAyKa and follow given instructions.

Renotkil North America Inc., dba
Name of Bidder: Target Specialty Products
(This form to be returned)
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SCHEDULE OF PRICING

PREFERRED

PRODUCT NAME UNIT UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE PER EXCEPTION
e PACKAGING GALLON/POUND
Name Brand Product — No Substitutions:
1 | Dibrom Concentrate 30-gallon drum | ¢ NO BID $ NOBID
o | Altosid Briquets — 150 Day 220/case $818.40/ case | $ 3.72 / briquet
3 | Altosid Liquid (5%) 4 gallons/case | ¢ 114412/ case | § 286.03/ gallon
2x25
4 | Altosid Liquid (20%) gallon/case | $5.088.50/case | $1,017.70 / gallon
44-pound
5 | Altosid Pellets case $1.215.72/cese | § 27.63 / pound
120-gallon sanmime g | $90.26 1 gallon (Zenivex E4)
6 | Zenivex mini-tote $ msoromgumnem) | 318,84/ gallon (Zenivex E20)
7 | Captain XTR 2.5-gallon | §102.60 / jug | $41.04 / gallon
8 | Reward 2.5gallon | $940 00 / jug| $96.00 / gallon
Cutrine®-Plus Algecide-
9 | Granular 30-pound bag | ¢ 86 40 / bag | $2.88 / pound
10 | Deltagard (PeftaGard and imperium) gallon $ 270.50/galion | $ 270.50/ galion
11_| Sonar SRP 40-pound pail | $NO BID $ NO BID
12 | Avast o gallon $NO BID $ NO BID
13 | Trycera (aquatic use) galion $NO BID s NOBID
14 | Garlon 4 gallon $NO BID $ NOBID
15 | Diguat SPC gallon $108.25/ gallon| $108.25 / gallon
16_| Natular G30 40-poundbag | ¢NOBID | g NOBID
220 tablet/
17 | Natular XRT case sNO BID $ NO BID
Central Life Sciences Duplex-G
18 | Larvicide 40-pound bag | ¢629 40 /bag | $15.56 / pound
19 | Duet - Adulticide 30-gallon drum | ¢ NO BID $ NO BID
20 | Fourstar 36-poundbag | NOBID | g NOBID
21 | Metatarve-Larvicide-Granular pound | §NO BID $ NO BID
22 | Top Film-Adjuvant 25-gallon | NO BID $ NOBID
23 | Duplex-G Larvicide 40-pound bag | 562 40/bag | $15.56 / pound
24 | Vectobac-AS 25gallon | ¢NOBID |g NOBID
25 | Vectobac-AS 30-gallon drum | ¢ NO BID s NOBID

Name of Bidder: Rentokil North America, DBA Target Specialty Products

(This form to be returned)
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SCHEDULE OF PRICING — CONTINUED

PREFERRED
PRODUCT NAME UNIT UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE PER EXCEPTION
PACKAGING GALLON/POUND
26 | Vectoprime FG pound ¢$NO BID s NO BID
27 | Vectobac GS 40-pound bag | $64.80 /bag | § 1.62 / pound _[Brand Bid: Sunmit 8u Grenus (10/14 mesh)
28 | Vectomax FG 40-pound bag | $NO BID $ NO BID
29 | Vectrobac GR 40-poundbag | $64.80/bag | $1.62/pound [Brand Bid: Summit B Granules (5/8 mesh)
275-galion
30 | Zenivex E20 mini-tote $87,681.00/tote | $318.84 /gallon
31 | Tribune gallon $74.60/gallon | $74.60/ calion  |Available in 2.5 gallon jugs
32 | Rodeo 2;1?r;ig-fcl>ltzn $ ;gsgégogal tote | $29.80/ gallon Riraariilgbalédi:nRzosusng:ﬁo%l:g}gm
33 | Basil Oil gallon $NOC BID $ NO BID
34 | Greenclean-Pro 50-pound bag | $99.50 /bag | $1.99 / pound
35 | Alligare Triclopyr4 gallon $64.00 / gallon | $64.00/gallon _|Available in 2.5 gallon jugs
36 | Kontrol 30/30 Z;is;i;ﬂt:n $24,062.50 /tote | $ 87.50 / gallon Brand Bid: Perm-X UL 30-30
37 | Vectomax WSP 25-galion  |$ NOBID NO BID
38 | AquaStrike 2.5-gallon | $NO BID s NOBID
39 Aquathol Super K 20-pound bag $NO BID $ NO BID
40 | SonarA.S. 10-pound $NO BID $ NOBID
41 | Trycera (aguatic use) 2.5-gallon sNO BID $ NO BID
42 | Duet-HD Adulticide 30-galion drum | $§NO BID $ NOBID
43 | Fyfanon EW 2.5-galion | $NO BID $NO BID
44 | Merus Adulticide 2.5-gallon | $NO BID $ NO BID
45 | ReMoaTRI 30-gallon drum | $NO BID $ NO BID
4¢ | FalioutiQ 95.qalon | $85.75/jug | s 34.30/ gallon
47_[| Fatoutt@ 30-gallon drum | $1,029.00 / drum| $ 34.30 / gallon
Sumilarv 0.5G WSP oo
48 _ packetsfcase | $646.10/case | $ 1.61525 / packet |
49 | Sumilarv 0.5G bl(;:/::sge $468.60 / case | $ 46.85 / kilogram

Name of Bidder: R€ntokil North America, DBA Target Specialty Products
(This form to be returned)
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SCHEDULE OF PRICING — CONTINUED

PRODUCT NAME PREFERRED EXCEPTION
UNIT UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE PER
PACKAGING GALLON/POUND
Generics - Non-Brand Specific: {
45 | B.T.I. (11% or higher) | 30-gallon drum | $NO BID $ NOBID
46 | B.T.. (11%orhigher) | 2.5-gallon | $NO BID g NOBID
275-gallon
47 Permanone 30-30 mini-tote $23,375.00/tole | § 85.00/ gallon
Available in 30 gallon drums or 2x2.5
48 | Permanone 30-30 gallon $85.00/ gallon | $85.00/ gallon gallon cases.
49 | Deltmethrin gallon $270.50 / gallon | $270.50/ galion | Brand Bid: Imperium
50 | 2,4-D amine 46% $39.00/jug |$ 15.60/ gallon |Brand Bid: Alligare Amine 2,4-D
(aquatic) 2.5-gallon
51 Copper Algecide- $NOBID $ NOBID
Liquid 2.5-gallon
52 | Copper Sulfate $ NO BID $ NOBID
Pentahydrate 99% 30-gallon
53 | Copper Sulfate $ NO BID $ NO BID
Pentahydrate 99% 50-pound bag
54 | Diguat dibromide $158.50 / jug | $ 63.40/ gallon | Brand Bid: Alligare Diquat
37.3% (aquatic) 2.5-gallon
55 | Fluridone 41.7% $ NO BID $ NOBID
(aquatic) 2,5-galion o
56 | Glyphosate 53.8% $ 80.25/jug | $ 32.10/ gallon |Brand Bid: Roundup Custom
(aguatic) 2.5-gailon
57 | Glyphosate 41% $ 49.00/jug |$ 19.60/gallon | Brand Bid: Ranger Pro
(terrestrial) 2.5-gallon
58 Hydrogen Peroxide $ NOBID $ NO BID
Algaecide 15-galion
59 | Triclopyr Amine $187.40/jug | $ 74.96 / gallon | Brand Bid Triclopyr 3A
44.4% (aquatic) 2.5-galion
60 | Triclopry Ester 61.6% 15-gallon sNO BID $ NO BID
61 Spray Indicator Dye 15-gallon $NO BID $ NO BID
62 Surfactant, 90% $26.00/ gallon | # $26.00/ gallon |Brand Bid: Target Pro Spreader
Nonionic gallon
90/10 Non-ionic
63 Spreader/Sticker gallon $26.00/ gallon | $ 26.00/ gallon Brand Bid: Target Pro Spreader
64 | Malathion gallon $68.50/ gallon | $68.50/ gallon Brand Bid: Malathion 5EC
65 | Cutrine Liguid 2.5-gallon $91.50/jug |$ 36.60/ gallon |Brand Bid: Cutrine Plus

Name of Bidder: Rentokil North America, DBA Target Specialty Products

(This form to be returned)
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If notified of the acceptance of this bid form, the undersigned agrees to execute a Contract for the stated compensation in the
form as prescribed by the County, within the time constraints outlined in Instructions to Bidders.

The signature below is a guarantee that the Bidder will not withdraw his/her bid for a period of sixty (60) days after the
scheduled time for opening the bids.

In accordance with section 287.135, Florida Statutes, the undersigned certifies that the company is not on the Scrutinized
Companies with Activities in Sudan List, the Scrutinized Companies with Activities in the Iran Petroleum Energy Sector List,
and does not have business operations in Cuba or Syria (if applicabie) or the Scrutinized Companies that Boycott Israel List,
or is not participating in a boycott of Israel.

The undersigned acknowledges receipt of the following addenda, and the cost, if any, of such revisions has been included in
the price bid.

Addendum No. , Dated . Addendum No. , Dated . Addendum No. , Dated
Addendum No. , Dated ; Addendum No. , Dated . Addendum No. , Dated

HOLD HARMLESS AGREEMENT: The bidding firm as indicated below, through the signing of this document by any
authorized party or agent, indemnify, hold harmless and defend Charlotte County, a political subdivision of the State of
Florida, its officers, agents, employees, and volunteers from all suits and actions, including attorney’s fees and all costs of
litigation and judgment of every name and description brought against the County as a result of loss, damage or injury to
person or property by reason of any act or failure to act by the bidding firm, its agents, servants or employees.

Type of Organization (Please Check One):  Individual Ownership Joint Venture

Partnership Corporation \V4

Name of Bidding Firm __Target Specialty Products
Mailing Address 11301 Industriplex Blvd, STE 100 Baton Rouge LA 70809

Location Address 5410 Pioneer Park Blvd. Suite A

City & State _1ampa, FL zip 33634
321-436-5603 Marty or

Marty.Shuster@Target-Specialty.com & Kirsti.Rodney@Target-Specialty.com

Telephone: E-mail:

Signature of person authorized to bind the Company: %@ﬁ 73*&/&?7,_

Kirsti Rodney/ Vetior Customer Service Representative

Print Name/Title of person authorized to bind the Company:
Date: 11/10/2023

(This form to be returned)
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SOURCE OF SUPPLY AND SUBCONTRACTORS

The following sources of supply and subcontractors shall be used for INSECTICIDES AND HERBICIDES — ANNUAL
CONTRACT. (If quoter does not have a source of supply or subcontractor, insert "to be determined”. When source or
subcontractor is determined, selection will be subject to County approval. If not applicable, please state N/A).

Source of Supply Subcontractor(s)

Envu- formerly known as Bayer 1.
Central Life Sciences 2
MGK 3.
Summit 4.
5.

6.

DRUG FREE WORKPLACE FORM

The undersigned vendor in accordance with Florida Statute 287.087 hereby certifies that _Target Specialty Products
(name of business) does:

1. Publish a statement notifying employees that the unlawful manufacture, distribution, dispensing, possession, or use
of a controlled substance is prohibited in the workplace and specifying the actions that will be taken against employees
for violations of such prohibition.

2. Inform employees about the dangers of drug abuse in the workplace, the business's policy of maintaining a drug-
free workplace, any available drug counseling, rehabilitation, and employee assistance programs, and the penalties that
may be imposed upon employees for drug abuse viclations.

3. Give each employee engaged in providing the commodities or contractual services that are under bid a copy of the
statement specified in subsection (1).

4. In the statement specified in subsection (1), notify the employees that, as a condition of working on the commodities
or contractual services that are under bid, the employee will abide by the terms of the statement and will notify the
employer of any conviction of, or plea of guilty or nolo contendere to, any violation of Chapter 893 or of any controlled
substance law of the United States or any state, for a violation occurring in the workplace no later than five (5) days
after such conviction.

5. Impose a sanction on, or require the satisfactory participation in a drug abuse assistance or rehabilitation program if
such is available in the employee's community, by any employee who is so convicted.

6. Make a good faith effort to continue to maintain a drug-free workplace through implementation of this section.

As the person authorized to sign the statement, | certify that this firm complies fully with the above requirements.

a/
Signature ;’F,/z»cé,_z_;j 73‘“‘&1@;{7«

Dated  11/10/2023
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BYRD ANTI-LOBBYING CERTIFICATION

Certification for Contracts, Grants, Loans. and Cooperative Agreements

The undersigned certifies, to the best of his or her knowledge and belief, that:

(1) No Federal appropriated funds have been paid or will be paid, by or on behalf of the undersigned, to any person for
influencing or attempting to influence an officer or employee of any agency, a Member of Congress, an officer or employee of
Congress, or an employee of a Member of Congress in connection with the awarding of any Federal contract, the making of
an Federal grant, the making of any Federal loan, the entering into of any cooperative agreement, and the extension,
continuation, renewal, amendment, or modification of any Federal contract, grant, loan, or cooperative agreement,

(2) If any funds other than Federal appropriated funds have been paid or will be paid to any person for influencing or
attempting to influence an officer or employee of any agency, a Member of Congress, an officer or employee of Congress, or
an employee of a Member of Congress in connection with this Federal contract, grant, loan, or cooperative agreement, the
undersigned shall complete and submit Standard Form-LLL, “Disclosure Form to Report Lobbying,” in accordance with its
instructions.

(3) The undersigned shall require that the language of this certification be included in the award documents for all subawards
at all tiers (including subcontracts, subgrants, and contracts under grants, loans and cooperative agreements) and that all
subrecipients shall certify and disclose accordingly.

This certification is a material representation of fact upon which reliance was placed when this transaction was made or
entered into. Submission of this certification is a prerequisite for making or entering into this transaction imposed by Section
1352, Title 31, U.S.C." Any person who fails to file the required certification shall be subject to a civil penalty of not less than
$10,000 and not more than $100,000 for each such failure. -

11/10/2023 Kirsti Rodney
Date Type or Print Name

%L"@‘.& ﬁr‘ﬂﬂa

Signature J; =

Vector Customer Service
Representative

Title
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November 9, 2023
Re: Charlotte County, FL. Bid
To Whom it May Concern,

Envu is the only manufacturer of DeltaGard® Insecticide (US Patent #9,497,971),
Imperium Insecticide® (US Patent #9,497,971), Permanone®, and Aqua-Reslin®.

Since February 15, 2020 Target Specialty Products is the sole distributor with
access to purchase these products from Envu serving the professional vector
control market for these products in the United States, Puerto Rico and the
Caribbean Islands. No other distributor has access to purchase these products
from Envu. Currently, only Target Specialty Products is authorized to purchase the
products listed above and provide supply through the 2023/24 season.

We appreciate your interest in Envu Products. If there are further questions, or if
there is additional information that you need, please do not hesitate to call. We
look forward to working with you this season; providing best in class solutions,
resistance management, and field validated results.

Thank you for your support and your business.

Sincerely,

Shawn Mullen

Mosquito Account Manager



VMGK

November 14, 2023

Dear Sir or Madam:

This letter serves as confirmation that Target Specialty Products is a distribution partner for
MGK’s public health portfolio of products in the United States. These products include, but not
restricted to the following:

e EverGreen ULV Ground (5-25) EPA Reg. No. 1021-1199

o EcverGreen ULV Air (5-25) EPA Reg. No. 1021-1569

o EverGreen Mosquito Adulticide EC (60-6) EPA Reg. No. 1021-1770
¢ Sumilarv 0.5G EPA Reg. No. 1021-2819

e Sumilarv WSP EPA Reg. No. 1021-2818

These materials contain proprietary ingredients and unique formulation technology that gives the
products superior performance attributes. We have a long history of working with Target Specialty
Products in this market. We find this arrangement gives MGK the best chance to reach customers
with the support necessary to serve the Vector/Public Health market. Please let me know should
you need further details.

Sincerely

Brian Krelitz
MGK Sr. Marketing Manager, Professional & Vector/Public Health

7375 Aspen Lane North ! FRL! 800.645.6466
Minneapolis, MN 55428 1f 763.544.0341
FA - 763.544.6437
WWw.MGK.COM



A

CENTRAL

LIFE SCIENCES

November 9, 2022

To: Central Life Sciences Agency Agreement product Purchasers

Wellmark International (DBA Central Life Sciences) is the sole manufacturer of Altosid®,
Zenivex®, Duplex® and Strike® mosquito, Midge & Filter Fly larvicide products and markets
these products in the U.S. under agency agreement distribution. Agency Agreement allows
Central Life Sciences to sell direct to end-use public agencies through 4 authorized Agent
companies.

During calendar year 2022 & 2023, the following companies are authorized Central Life
Sciences contract Agents allowed to advertise, promote, solicit, and sell Agency products in all
U.S. states where the products are registered. The enclosed end-use customer list pricing for
2022 and 2023 respectively is Central Life Sciences’ price for all U.S. customers offered
exclusively through the following authorized agents:

Clarke Mosquito Control
Target Specialty Products
Veseris

Van Diest Supply Company

All inquiries and/or purchases of Altosid, Zenivex, Duplex or Strike products can be made
through any of the Agent companies listed here.

Additionally, these four agents are authorized to advertise, promote, solicit, and sell the
following Central Life Sciences non-agency priced product lines in all U.S. states where the
products are registered: Pyronyl™ and Perm-X™ adulticides.

Regards,

T

Tim Bennett
Business Manager - Vector

1501 East Woodfield Rd., 200W, Schaumburg, IL 60173 e www.centrallitesciences.com



Summit ... resporsible solition.

November 13, 2023
To Whom it may Concern:

Target Specialty Products is the authorized distributor for Summit Chemical Company products including
Fallout WDG, Fallout LQ, Summit Bti Briquets, and Summit Bti Granules. Summit has contracted with
them to bid on all tenders for our products and have our full support.

Best regards,

Zachary Cohen
Vice President
Summit Chemical Company

1 235 5. K st
S u m m |‘t Baltimurree,snsnu[;] 21224-2616

solitions,  800-227-8664 www.summitchemical.com



ACORD’
\ : CERTIFICATE OF LIA

DATE (MM/DD/YYYY)
9/22/2023

BILITY INSURANCE

THI—S CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS

CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND,

BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED

REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.

EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES

IMPORTANT: If the certificate holder is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(ies) must have ADDITIONAL INSURED provisions or be endorsed.
If SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to the terms and conditions of the policy, certain policies may require an endorsement. A statement on
this certificate does not confer rights to the certificate holder in lieu of such endorsement(s).

BRODUCER RAMEACT Certificate Unit
Edgewood Partners Insurance Center :ﬁgﬁé' 404-781-1700 T lmxi B
5909 Peachtree Dunwoody Road, Suite 800 T T —[IAIC,No): -
Atlanta GA 30328 ADDREss: certificate@epicbrokers.com -
= INSURER(S) AFFORDING COVERAGE NAIC #
I _ _ License#: 0B829370| INSURER A : ACE American Insurance Company 22667
"&s::fgk“ North America. Inc RENTOKI-O1| \ surer B : ACE Property and Casualty Insurance Co 20699
dba Target Specialty Products (REN141) INSURER ¢ : Arch Insurance Company 11150
1125 Berkshire Blvd., Suite 150 INSURER D : AXIS Insurance Company 37273
Wyomissing PA 19610 INSURER E : Arch Indemnity Insurance Company 30830
INSURERF :

COVERAGES CERTIFICATE NUMBER: 149811721

REVISION NUMBER:

THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD

INDICATED. NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION
CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORD
EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE

OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS
ED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN IS SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS,
BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS.

INSR ADDL SUBR POLICY EFF | POLICY EXP | o
LTR _ TYPE OF INSURANCE INSD | WVD POLICY NUMBER (MM/DD/YYYY) | (MM/DD/YYYY) LIMITS
A 1 | COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY 0OGLG27240331 10/1/2023 10/1/2024 | EACH OCCURRENCE | $5,000,000
[ DAMAGE TO RENTED S
| CLAIMS-MADE OCCUR | PREMISES (Ea occurrence) | $5,000,000
MED EXP (Any one person) $ 10,000
I _ — | |
| | PERSONAL & ADV INJURY | § 5,000,000 ]
| GEN'L AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER: | | GENERAL AGGREGATE $ 5,000,000 ]
| X | poLicy s Loc | PRODUCTS - COMP/OP AGG | $ 5,000,000
QTHER: kit
C | AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY 31CAB1044403 (AOS) 10//2023 | 10/1/2024 | GOMENERSINGLELIMIT | 5 5,000,000
X | ANY AUTO 31CAB1044503 (MA) 10/1/2023 10/1/2024 BODILY INJURY (Per person) | §
l | D Ly | _l s BODILY INJURY (Per accident)| $ -
HIRED NON-OWNED " PROPERTY DAMAGE $
|| AUTOS ONLY | AUTOS ONLY | (Peraccident) __
| $
B | X .. UMBRELLA LIAB X | occur X00G27239420 10/1/2023 : 10/1/2024 | EACH OCCURRENCE $ 5,000,000
| EXCESS LIAB CLAIMS-MADE | AGGREGATE $ 5,000,000
| pep | X | RETENTIONS 10 nan £
G |WORKERS COMPENSATION | 31WCI1044203 (FL) 10/1/2023 | 10/1/2024 |X | BERL o[ [ 9T
E |AND EMPLOYERS' LIABILITY YIN 34WCI1044303 (AOS) 10/1/2023 10/1/2024 =
C | ANYPROPRIETOR/PARTNER/EXECUTIVE 31WCX1063301 (OH) 10/1/2023 | 10/1/2024 | E.L. EACH ACCIDENT $ 2,000,000
OFFICER/MEMBEREXCLUDED? N/A | =
(Mandatory in NH) | E.L. DISEASE - EA EMPLOYEE| $ 2,000,000
If yes, describe under |
DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS below E.L. DISEASE - POLICY LIMIT | $ 2,000,000
A | Errors & Omissions Liability OGLG27240331 10/1/2023 | 10/1/2024 | Each Incident/Agg $5,000,000
D | Crime/Client Coverage N | N | P-001-000968899-02 | 10/1/2023 10/1/2024 | Each Occurrence $1,000,000
|

DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS / LOCATIONS / VEHICLES (ACORD 101, Additional Remarks Schedul

may be attached if more space is required)

CERTIFICATE HOLDER

CANCELLATION

SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE
THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTICE WILL BE DELIVERED IN
ACCORDANCE WITH THE POLICY PROVISIONS.

Evidence of Insurance

AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE

Jirlh typerit

ACORD 25 (2016/03)

© 1988-2015 ACORD CORPORATION. All rights reserved.

The ACORD name and logo are registered marks of ACORD



Request for Taxpayer
Identification Number and Certification
Department of the Treasury

Internal Revenue Service » Go to www.irs.gov/FormW9 for instructions and the latest information.
1 Name (as shown an your income tax retum). Name is required on this line; do not leave this line biank.

Give Form to the
requester. Do not
send to the IRS.

Form W"' 9

(Rev. October 2018)

Rentokil North America, Inc.
2 Business name/disregarded entity name, if different from above

Target Specialty Products

3 Check appropriate box for federal tax classification of the person whose name is entered on line 1. Check only one of the | 4 Exemptions (codes apply only to
following seven boxes. certain entities, not individuals; see
instructions on page 3):

|:| Individual/sole proprietor or C Corporation D S Corporation D Partnership D Trust/estate

single-member LLC Exempt payee code (if any) 5

El Limited liability company. Enter the tax classification (C=C corporation, S=S corporation, P=Partnership) »
Note: Check the appropriate box in the line above for the tax classification of the single-member owner. Do not check | Exemption from FATCA reporting
LLC if the LLC is classified as a single=member LLC that is disregarded from the owner unless the owner of the LLC is code (i any)
another LLC that is not disregarded from the owner for U.S. federal tax purposes. Otherwise, a single-member LLC that Y

Print or type.

[ Other (see instructions) »

is disregarded from the owner should check the appropriate box for the tax classification of its owner.

{Applies to accounts maintained outside the U.S.)

5 Address (number, street, and apt. or suite no.) See instructions.

P.O. Box 14084

See Specific Instructions on page 3.

Requester’s name and address {optional)

6 City, state, and ZIP code
Reading, PA 19612

7 List account number{s) here (optional)

Taxpayer Identification Number (TIN)

Enter your TIN in the appropriate box. The TIN provided must match the name given on line 1 to avoid
backup withholding. For individuals, this is generally your social security number (SSN). However, for a
resident alien, sole proprietor, or disregarded entity, see the instructions for Part |, later. For other - -
entities, it is your employer identification number (EIN). If you do not have a number, see How to get a

TIN, later.

Note: If the account is in more than one name, see the instructions for line 1. Also see What Name and
Number To Give the Requester for guidelines on whose number to enter.,

| social security number

or
Employer identification number |

2|3| -/ 1|5(6/8]3|5|0

Part i Certification

Under penalties of perjury, | certify that:

1. The number shown on this form is my correct taxpayer identification number {or | am waiting for a number to be issued to me); and
2. | am not subject to backup withholding because: {a) | am exempt from backup withholding, or (o} | have not been notified by the Internal Revenue
Service (IRS) that | am subject to backup withholding as a result of a failure to report all interest or dividends, or (c) the IRS has notified me that | am

no longer subject to backup withholding; and
3. lam a U.S. citizen or other U.S. person (defined below); and

4, The FATCA code(s) entered on this form (if any) indicating that | am exempt from FATCA reporting is correct.

Certification instructions. You must cross out item 2 above if you have been natified by the RS that you are currently subject to backup withholding because
you have failed to report all interest and dividends on your tax return, For real estate transactions, item 2 does not apply. For mortgage interest paid,
acquisition or abandonment of secured property, cancellation of debt, contributions to an individual retirement arrangement (IRA), and generally, payments
other than interest and dividends, you are not required to sign the certification, but you must provide your correct TIN. See the instructions for Part Il, later.

s'Qn Signature of
Here U.S. person >

OHAL /Dt

pate» 01/01/2023

General Instructions

Section references are to the Intemal Revenue Code unless otherwise
noted.

Future developments. For the latest information about developments
related to Form W-9 and its instructions, such as legislation enacted
after they were published, go to www.irs.gov/FormWa.

Purpose of Form

An individual or entity (Form W-9 requester) who is required to file an
information return with the IRS must obtain your correct taxpayer
identification number (TIN) which may be your social security number
(SSN), individual taxpayer identification number (ITIN), adoption
taxpayer identification number (ATIN), or employer identification number
(EIN), to report on an information return the amount paid to you, or other
amount reportable on an information return. Examples of information
returns include, but are not limited to, the following.

¢ Form 1099-INT (interest earned or paid)

* Form 1099-DIV {dividends, including those from stocks or mutual
funds)

* Form 1099-MISC (various types of income, prizes, awards, or gross
proceeds)

* Form 1099-B (stock or mutual fund sales and cenrtain other
transactions by brokers)

» Form 1099-S (proceeds from real estate transactions)

» Form 1099-K (merchant card and third party network transactions)
¢ Form 1098 (home mortgage interest), 1098-E (student loan interest),
1098-T (tuition)

¢ Form 1099-C (canceled debt)

* Form 1099-A (acquisition or abandonment of secured property)

Use Form W-9 only if you are a U.S. person {including a resident
alien), to provide your correct TIN.

If you do not return Form W-9 to the requester with a TIN, you might
be subject to backup withholding. See What is backup withholding,
later.

Cat. No. 10231X

Form W=9 (Rev. 10-2018)
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By signing the filled-out form, you:

1. Certify that the TIN you are giving is correct (or you are waiting for a
number to be issued),

2. Certify that you are not subject to backup withholding, or

3. Claim exemption from backup withholding if you are a U.S. exempt
payee. If applicable, you are also certifying that as a U.S. person, your
allocable share of any partnership income from a U.S. trade or business
is not subject to the withholding tax on foreign partners' share of
effectively connected income, and

4. Certify that FATCA code(s) entered on this form (if any) indicating
that you are exempt from the FATCA reporting, is correct. See What is
FATCA reporting, later, for further information.

Note: If you are a U.S. person and a requester gives you a form other
than Form W-9 to request your TIN, you must use the requester’s form if
it is substantially similar to this Form W-9.

Definition of a U.S. person. For federal tax purposes, you are
considered a U.S. person if you are:

¢ An individual who is a U.S. citizen or U.S. resident alien;

* A partnership, corporation, company, or association created or
organized in the United States or under the laws of the United States;

» An estate (other than a foreign estate); or
¢ A domestic trust {(as defined in Regulations section 301.7701-7).

Special rules for partnerships. Partnerships that conduct a trade or
business in the United States are generally required to pay a withholding
tax under section 1446 on any foreign partners’ share of effectively
connected taxable income from such business. Further, in certain cases
where a Form W-9 has not been received, the rules under section 1446
require a partnership to presume that a partner is a foreign person, and
pay the section 1446 withholding tax, Therefore, if you are a U.S. person
that is a partner in a partnership conducting a trade or business in the
United States, provide Form W-9 to the partnership to establish your
U.S. status and avoid section 1446 withholding on your share of
partnership income,

In the cases below, the following person must give Form W-9 to the
partnership for purposes of establishing its U.S. status and avoiding
withholding on its allocable share of net income from the partnership
conducting a trade or business in the United States.

* In the case of a disregarded entity with a U.S. owner, the U.S. owner
of the disregarded entity and not the entity;

» In the case of a grantor trust with a U.S. grantor or other U.S. owner,
generally, the U.S. grantor or other U.S. owner of the grantor trust and
not the trust; and

* |n the case of a U,S. trust (other than a grantor trust), the U.S. trust
(other than a grantor trust) and not the beneficiaries of the trust.

Foreign person. if you are a foreign person or the U.S. branch of a
foreign bank that has elected to be treated as a U.S. person, do not use
Form W-9. Instead, use the appropriate Form W-8 or Form 8233 (see
Pub, 515, Withholding of Tax on Nonresident Aliens and Foreign
Entities).

Nonresident alien who becomes a resident alien. Generally, only a
nonresident alien individual may use the terms of a tax treaty to reduce
or eliminate U.S. tax on certain types of income. However, most tax
treaties contain a provision known as a “saving clause.” Exceptions
specified in the saving clause may permit an exemption from tax to
continue for certain types of income even after the payee has otherwise
become a U.S. resident alien for tax purposes.

If you are a U.S. resident alien who is relying on an exception
contained in the saving clause of a tax treaty to claim an exemption
from U.S. tax on certain types of income, you must attach a statement
to Form W-9 that specifies the following five items.

1. The treaty country. Generally, this must be the same treaty under
which you claimed exemption from tax as a nonresident alien.

2, The treaty article addressing the income.

3. The article number (or location) in the tax treaty that contains the
saving clause and its exceptions.

4, The type and amount of income that qualifies for the exemption
from tax.

5. Sufficient facts to justify the exemption from tax under the terms of
the treaty article.

Example. Article 20 of the U.S.-China income tax treaty allows an
exemption from tax for scholarship income received by a Chinese
student temporarily present in the United States. Under U.S. law, this
student will become a resident alien for tax purposes if his or her stay in
the United States exceeds 5 calendar years. However, paragraph 2 of
the first Protocol to the U.S.-China treaty (dated April 30, 1984) allows
the provisions of Article 20 to continue to apply even after the Chinese
student becomes a resident alien of the United States. A Chinese
student who qualifies for this exception (under paragraph 2 of the first
protocol) and is relying on this exception to claim an exemption from tax
on his or her scholarship or fellowship income would attach to Form
W-9 a statement that includes the information described above to
support that exemption.

If you are a nonresident alien or a foreign entity, give the requester the
appropriate completed Form W-8 or Form 8233.

Backup Withholding

What is backup withholding? Persons making certain payments to you
must under certain conditions withhold and pay to the IRS 24% of such
payments. This is called “backup withholding.” Payments that may be
subject to backup withholding include interest, tax-exempt interest,
dividends, broker and barter exchange transactions, rents, royalties,
nonemployee pay, payments made in settlement of payment card and
third party network transactions, and certain payments from fishing boat
operators. Real estate transactions are not subject to backup
withholding.

You will not be subject to backup withholding on payments you
receive if you give the requester your correct TIN, make the proper
certifications, and report all your taxable interest and dividends on your
tax return.

Payments you receive will be subject to backup withholding if:
1. You do not furnish your TIN to the requester,

2. You do not certify your TIN when required (see the instructions for
Part Il for details),

3. The IRS tells the requester that you furnished an incorrect TIN,

4. The IRS tells you that you are subject to backup withholding
because you did not report all your interest and dividends on your tax
return (for reportable interest and dividends only), or

5. You do not certify to the requester that you are not subject to
backup withholding under 4 above (for reportable interest and dividend
accounts opened after 1983 only).

Certain payees and payments are exempt from backup withholding.
See Exempt payee code, later, and the separate Instructions for the
Requester of Form W-9 for more information.

Also see Special rules for partnerships, earlier.

What is FATCA Reporting?

The Fareign Account Tax Compliance Act (FATCA) requires a
participating foreign financial institution to report all United States
account holders that are specified United States persons. Certain
payees are exempt from FATCA reporting. See Exemption from FATCA
reporting code, later, and the Instructions for the Requester of Form
W-9 for more information.

Updating Your Information

You must provide updated information to any person to whom you
claimed to be an exempt payee if you are no longer an exempt payee
and anticipate receiving reportable payments in the future from this
person. Far example, you may need to provide updated information if
you are a C corporation that elects to be an S corporation, or if you no
longer are tax exempt. In addition, you must furnish a new Form W-g if
the name or TIN changes for the account; for example, if the grantor of a
grantor trust dies,

Penalties

Failure to furnish TIN. If you fail to furish your correct TIN to a
requester, you are subject to a penalty of $50 for each such failure
unless your failure is due to reasonable cause and not to willful neglect.

Civil penalty for false information with respect to withholding. If you
make a false statement with no reasonable basis that results in no
backup withhelding, you are subject to a $500 penalty.
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Criminal penalty for falsifying information. Willfully falsifying
certifications or affirmations may subject you to criminal penalties
including fines and/or imprisonment.

Misuse of TINs. If the requester discloses or uses TINs in violation of
federal law, the requester may be subject to civil and criminal penalties.

Specific Instructions

Line 1

You must enter one of the following on this line; do not leave this line
blank. The name should match the name on your tax retum.

If this Form W-9 is for a joint account (other than an account
maintained by a foreign financial institution (FFI)), list first, and then
circle, the name of the person or entity whose number you entered in
Part | of Form W-9. If you are providing Form W-9 to an FFl to document
a joint account, each holder of the account that is a U.S. person must
provide a Form W-9,

a. Individual. Generally, enter the name shown on your tax return. if
you have changed your last name without informing the Social Security
Administration (SSA} of the name change, enter your first name, the last
name as shown on your social security card, and your new last name.

Note: ITIN applicant: Enter your individual name as it was entered on
your Form W-7 application, line 1a. This should also be the same as the
name you entered on the Form 1040/1040A/1040EZ you filed with your
application.

b. Sole proprietor or single-member LLC. Enter your individual
name as shown on your 1040/1040A/1040EZ on line 1. You may enter
your business, trade, or “doing business as” (DBA) name on line 2.

c¢. Partnership, LLC that is not a single-member LLC, C
corporation, or § corporation. Enter the entity's name as shown on the
entity's tax return on line 1 and any business, trade, or DBA name on
line 2.

d. Other entities. Enter your name as shown on required U.S, federal
tax documents on line 1. This name should match the name shown on the
charter or other legal document creating the entity. You may enter any
business, trade, or DBA name on line 2.

e. Disregarded entity. For U.S. federal tax purposes, an entity that is
disregarded as an entity separate from its owner is treated as a
“disregarded entity.” See Regulations section 301.7701-2(c){2)(iii). Enter
the owner's name on line 1. The name of the entity entered on line 1
should never be a disregarded entity. The name on line 1 should be the
name shown on the income tax retum on which the income should be
reported. For example, if a foreign LLC that is treated as a disregarded
entity for U.S. federal tax purposes has a single owner that is a U.S.
person, the U.S. owner's name is required to be provided on line 1. If
the direct owner of the entity is also a disregarded entity, enter the first
owner that is not disregarded for federal tax purposes. Enter the
disregarded entity's name on line 2, “Business name/disregarded entity
name.” If the owner of the disregarded entity is a foreign person, the
owner must complete an appropriate Form W-8 instead of a Form W-9,
This is the case even if the foreign person has a U.S. TIN.

Line 2

If you have a business name, trade name, DBA name, or disregarded
entity name, you may enter it on line 2.

Line 3

Check the appropriate box on line 3 for the U.S. federal tax
classification of the person whose name is entered on line 1. Check only
one box on line 3.

IF the entity/person on line 1 is | THEN check the box for. ..

a(n)...

¢ Corporation Corporation

* Individual Individual/sole proprietor or single-
member LLC

» Sole proprietorship, or

* Single-member limited liability
company {LLC) owned by an
individual and disregarded for U.S.
federal tax purposes.

* LLC treated as a partnership for | Limited liability company and enter
U.S. federal tax purposes, the appropriate tax classification.

¢ LLC that has filed Form 8832 or | (P= Partnership; C= C corporation;
2553 to be taxed as a corporation, | or S= S corporation)

or

o LLC that is disregarded as an
entity separate from its owner but
the owner is another LLC that is
not disregarded for U.S. federal tax

purposes.
e Partnership Partnership
e Trust/estate Trust/estate

Line 4, Exemptions

If you are exempt from backup withholding and/or FATCA reporting,
enter in the appropriate space on line 4 any code(s) that may apply to
you.

Exempt payee code.

» Generally, individuals (including sole proprietors) are not exempt from
backup withholding.

» Except as provided below, corporations are exempt from backup
withholding for certain payments, including interest and dividends.

» Corporations are not exempt from backup withholding for payments
made in settlement of payment card or third party network transactions,

» Corporations are not exempt from backup withholding with respect to
attorneys’ fees or gross proceeds paid to attorneys, and corporations
that provide medical or health care services are not exempt with respect
to payments reportable on Form 1099-MISC.

The following codes identify payees that are exempt from backup
withholding. Enter the appropriate code in the space in line 4.

1—An organization exempt from tax under section 501(a}, any IRA, or
a custodial account under section 403(b)(7) if the account satisfies the
requirements of section 401{f)(2}

2~The United States or any of its agencies or instrumentalities

3—A state, the District of Columbia, a U.S. commonwealth or
possession, or any of their political subdivisions or instrumentalities

4—A foreign government or any of its political subdivisions, agencies,
or instrumentalities
5—A corporation

6—A dealer in securities or commodities required to register in the
United States, the District of Columbia, or a U.S. commonwealth or
possession

7—A futures commission merchant registered with the Commodity
Futures Trading Commission
8—A real estate investment trust

9—An entity registered at all times during the tax year under the
Investment Company Act of 1940

10—A common trust fund operated by a bank under section 584(a)
11—A financial institution

12 —A middleman known in the investment community as a nominee or
custodian

13—A trust exempt from tax under section 664 or described in section
4947
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The following chart shows types of payments that may be exempt
from backup withholding. The chart applies to the exempt payees listed
above, 1 through 13.

THEN the payment is exempt
for...

IF the paymentis for...

Interest and dividend payments All exempt payees except

for7

Broker transactions Exempt payees 1 through 4 and 6
through 11 and all C corporations.
S corporations must not enter an
exempt payee code because they
are exempt only for sales of
noncovered securities acquired

prior to 2012.

Barter exchange transactions and
patronage dividends

Exempt payees 1 through 4

Payments over $600 required to be | Generally, exempt payees
reported and direct sales over 1 through 5°

$5,000'

Payments made in settlement of
payment card or third party network
transactions

Exempt payees 1 through 4

1 See Form 1099-MISC, Miscellaneous Income, and its instructions.

2 However, the following payments made to a corporation and
reportable on Form 1099-MISC are not exempt from backup

withholding: medical and health care payments, attorneys’ fees, gross
proceeds paid to an attorney reportable under section 6045(f}, and
payments for services paid by a federal executive agency.

Exemption from FATCA reporting code. The following codes identify
payees that are exempt from reporting under FATCA. These codes
apply to persons submitting this form for accounts maintained outside
of the United States by certain foreign financial institutions. Therefore, if
you are only submitting this form for an account you hold in the United
States, you may leave this field blank. Consult with the person
requesting this form if you are uncertain if the financial institution is
subject to these requirements. A requester may indicate that a code is
not required by providing you with a Form W-9 with “Not Applicable” (or
any similar indication) written or printed on the line for a FATCA
exemption code.

A~ An organization exempt from tax under section 501(a) or any
individual retirement plan as defined in section 7701(a)}(37)

B—The United States or any of its agencies or instrumentalities

C—A state, the District of Columbia, a U.S. commonwealth or
possession, or any of their political subdivisions or instrumentalities

D—A corporation the stock of which is regularly traded on one or
more established securities markets, as described in Regulations
section 1.1472-1(c)(1){)

E~—A corporation that is a member of the same expanded affiliated
group as a corporation described in Regulations section 1.1472-1(c)(1){i)

F—A dealer in securities, commodities, or derivative financial
instruments (including notional principal contracts, futures, forwards,
and options) that is registered as such under the laws of the United
States or any state

G—A real estate investment trust

H—A regulated investment company as defined in section 851 or an
entity registered at all times during the tax year under the Investment
Company Act of 1940

{—A common trust fund as defined in section 584(a)

J—A bank as defined in section 581

K—A broker

L—A trust exempt from tax under section 664 or described in section
4947(a)(1)

M—A tax exempt trust under a section 403(b) plan or section 457(g)
plan

Note: You may wish to consult with the financial institution requesting
this form to determine whether the FATCA code and/or exempt payee
code should be completed.

Line 5

Enter your address (number, street, and apartment or suite number).
This is where the requester of this Forrm W-9 will mail your information
returns. If this address differs from the one the requester already has on
file, write NEW at the top. If a new address is provided, there is still a
chance the old address will be used until the payor changes your
address in their records.

Line 6

Enter your city, state, and ZIP code.

Part I. Taxpayer Identification Number (TIN)

Enter your TIN in the appropriate box. If you are a resident alien and
you do not have and are not eligible to get an SSN, your TIN is your IRS
individual taxpayer identification number (ITIN). Enter it in the social
security number box. If you do not have an ITIN, see How to get a TIN
below.

If you are a sole proprietor and you have an EIN, you may enter either
your SSN or EIN.

If you are a single-member LLC that is disregarded as an entity
separate from its owner, enter the owner's SSN (or EIN, if the owner has
one). Do not enter the disregarded entity's EIN. if the LLC is classified as
a corporation or partnership, enter the entity’s EIN.

Note: See What Name and Number To Give the Requester, later, for
further clarification of name and TIN combinations.

How to get a TIN. If you do not have a TIN, apply for one immediately.
To apply for an SSN, get Form SS-5, Application for a Social Security
Card, from your local SSA office or get this form online at
www.SSA.gov, You may also get this form by calling 1-800-772-1213.
Use Form W-7, Application for IRS Individual Taxpayer Identification
Number, to apply for an ITIN, or Form S8-4, Application for Employer
Identification Number, to apply for an EIN. You can apply for an EIN
online by accessing the IRS website at www.irs.gov/Businesses and
clicking on Employer Identification Number (EIN) under Starting a
Business. Go to www.irs.gov/Forms to view, download, or print Form
W-7 and/or Form SS-4. Or, you can go to www.irs.gov/OrderForms to
place an order and have Form W-7 and/or SS-4 mailed to you within 10
business days.

If you are asked to complete Form W-9 but do not have a TIN, apply
for a TIN and write “Applied For” in the space for the TIN, sign and date
the form, and give it to the requester. For interest and dividend
payments, and certain payments made with respect to readily tradable
instruments, generally you will have 60 days to get a TIN and give it to
the requester before you are subject to backup withholding on
payments. The 60-day rule does not apply to other types of payments.
You will be subject to backup withholding on all such payments until
you provide your TIN to the requester.

Note: Entering “Applied For” means that you have already applied for a
TIN or that you intend to apply for one soon.

Caution: A disregarded U.S. entity that has a foreign owner must use
the appropriate Form W-8.

Part ll. Cenrtification

To establish to the withholding agent that you are a U.S. person, or
resident alien, sign Form W-9. You may be requested to sign by the
withholding agent even if item 1, 4, or 5 below indicates otherwise.

For a joint account, only the person whose TIN is shown in Part |
should sign (when required). In the case of a disregarded entity, the
person identified on line 1 must sign. Exempt payees, see Exempt payee
code, earlier.

Signature requirements. Complete the certification as indicated in
items 1 through 5 below.
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1. Interest, dividend, and barter exchange accounts opened
before 1984 and broker accounts considered active during 1983.
You must give your correct TIN, but you do not have to sign the
certification.

2. Interest, dividend, broker, and barter exchange accounts
opened after 1983 and broker accounts considered inactive during
1983. You must sign the certification or backup withholding will apply. If
you are subject to backup withholding and you are merely providing
your correct TIN to the requester, you must cross out item 2 in the
certification before signing the form.

3. Real estate transactions. You must sign the certification. You may
cross out item 2 of the certification.

4, Other payments. You must give your correct TIN, but you do not
have to sign the certification unless you have been notified that you
have previously given an incorrect TIN, “Other payments” include
payments made in the course of the requester’s trade or business for
rents, royalties, goods (other than bills for merchandise), medical and
health care services (including payments to corporations), payments to
a nonemployee for services, payments made in settlement of payment
card and third party network transactions, payments to certain fishing
boat crew members and fishermen, and gross proceeds paid to
attorneys (including payments to corporations).

5. Mortgage interest paid by you, acquisition or abandonment of
secured property, cancellation of debt, qualified tuition program
payments {under section 529), ABLE accounts (under section 529A),
IRA, Coverdell ESA, Archer MSA or HSA contributions or
distributions, and pension distributions. You must give your correct
TIN, but you do not have to sign the certification.

What Name and Number To Give the Requester

Give name and EIN of:
The public entity

For this type of account:
14. Account with the Department of
Agricutture in the name of a public
entity (such as a state or local
government, school district, or
prison) that receives agricultural
program payments

15. Grantor trust filing under the Form The trust
1041 Filing Method or the Optional
Form 1099 Filing Method 2 (see

Regulations section 1.671-4{b)(2)(}(B))

For this type of account: Give name and SSN of:

The individual

The actual owner of the account or, if
combined funds, the first individual on

the account’

ury

. Individual

n

. Two or more individuals {joint
account) other than an account
maintained by an FFI

w

. Two or more U.S. persons
{joint account maintained by an FFI)

Each holder of the account

& 2
The minor’

-

. Custodial account of a minor
{Uniform Gift to Minors Act)

. a. The usual revocable savings trust | The grantor—trustee1
(grantor is also trustee)
b. So-called trust account that is not| The actual owner’
alegal or valid trust under state law

[S)]

[=2]

. Sole proprietorship or disregarded The owner®

entity owned by an individual

~

. Grantor trust filing under Optional
Form 1099 Filing Method 1 (see
Regulations section 1.671-4(b){2)()
A)

The grantor”

For this type of account: Give name and EIN of:

The owner

o]

. Disregarded entity not owned by an
individual

9. A valid trust, estate, or pension trust | Legal entity”

10. Corporation or LLC electing The corporation
corporate status on Form 8832 or
Form 2553

11. Association, club, religious, The organization
charitable, educational, or other tax-
exempt organization

12. Partnership or multi-member LLC The partnership

The broker or nominee

13. A broker or registered nominee

1 List first and circle the name of the person whose number you furnish.
If only one person on a joint account has an SSN, that person’s number
must be furnished.

2 Circle the minor's name and furnish the minor's SSN.

# You must show your individual name and you may also enter your
business or DBA name on the “Business name/disregarded entity”
name line. You may use either your SSN or EIN (if you have one), but the
IRS encourages you to use your SSN.

4 List first and circle the name of the trust, estate, or pension trust. (Do
not furnish the TIN of the personal representative or trustee unless the
legal entity itself is not designated in the account title.) Also see Special
rules for partnerships, earlier.

*Note: The grantor also must provide a Form W-9 to trustee of trust.

Note: If no name is circled when more than one name is listed, the
number will be considered to be that of the first name listed.

Secure Your Tax Records From ldentity Theft

Identity theft occurs when someone uses your personal information
such as your name, SSN, or other identifying information, without your
permission, to commit fraud or other crimes. An identity thief may use
your SSN to get a job or may file a tax return using your SSN to receive
a refund.

To reduce your risk:
* Protect your SSN,
« Ensure your employer is protecting your SSN, and
¢ Be careful when choosing a tax preparer.

If your tax records are affected by identity theft and you receive a
notice from the IRS, respond right away to the name and phone number
printed on the IRS notice or letter.

If your tax records are not currently affected by identity theft but you
think you are at risk due to a lost or stolen purse or wallet, questionable
credit card activity or credit report, contact the IRS Identity Theft Hotline
at 1-800-908-4490 or submit Form 14039.

For more information, see Pub. 5027, ldentity Theft Information for
Taxpayers.

Victims of identity theft who are experiencing economic harm or a
systemic problem, or are seeking help in resolving tax problems that
have not been resolved through normal channels, may be eligible for
Taxpayer Advocate Service (TAS) assistance. You can reach TAS by
calling the TAS toll-free case intake line at 1-877-777-4778 or TTY/TDD
1-800-829-4059.

Protect yourself from suspicious emails or phishing schemes.
Phishing is the creation and use of email and websites designed to
mimic legitimate business emails and websites. The most common act
is sending an email to a user falsely claiming to be an established
legitimate enterprise in an attempt to scam the user into surrendering
private information that will be used for identity theft.
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The IRS does not initiate contacts with taxpayers via emails. Also, the
IRS does not request personal detailed information through email or ask
taxpayers for the PIN numbers, passwords, or similar secret access
information for their credit card, bank, or other financial accounts.

If you receive an unsolicited email claiming to be from the IRS,
forward this message to phishing@irs.gov. You may also report misuse
of the IRS name, logo, or other IRS property to the Treasury Inspector
General for Tax Administration (TIGTA) at 1-800-366-4484. You can
forward suspicious emails to the Federal Trade Commission at
spam@uce.gov or report them at www.ftc.gov/complaint. You can

contact the FTC at www.ftc.gov/idtheft or 877-IDTHEFT (877-438-4338).

If you have been the victim of identity theft, see www.IdentityTheft.gov
and Pub. 5027.

Visit www.irs.gov/IdentityTheft to learn more about identity theft and
how to reduce your risk.

Privacy Act Notice

Section 6109 of the Internal Revenue Code requires you to provide your
correct TIN to persons (including federal agencies) who are required to
file information returns with the IRS to report interest, dividends, or
certain other income paid to you; mortgage interest you paid; the
acquisition or abandonment of secured property; the cancellation of
debt; or contributions you made to an IRA, Archer MSA, or HSA. The
person collecting this form uses the information on the form to file
information returns with the IRS, reporting the above information.
Routine uses of this information include giving it to the Department of
Justice for civil and criminal litigation and to cities, states, the District of
Columbia, and U.S. commonwealths and possessions for use in
administering their laws. The information also may be disclosed to other
countries under a treaty, to federal and state agencies to enforce civil
and criminal laws, or to federal law enforcement and intelligence
agencies to combat terrorism. You must provide your TIN whether or
not you are required to file a tax return. Under section 3406, payers
must generally withhold a percentage of taxable interest, dividend, and
certain other payments to a payee who does not give a TIN to the payer.
Certain penalties may also apply for providing false or fraudulent
information.



