CHARLOTTE COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS

SHELL/ROCK MATERIAL - ANNUAL CONTRACT

BID TABULATION

BID NO. 2024000089

DUE DATE: 11/8/2023

DEPT: PW

Company Name:

CS Constructors

Nickale Corporation

Green Dream

Grippo Pavement

Description LLC International Maaintenance Inc.
Location Punta Gorda, FL Naples, FL Erie, PA Lehigh Acres, FL
SUPPLY ONLY:
*'$ 10.00 | $ 7.50 1293 | $ 10.00 *Previously awarded
Shell Rock Material| $ 10.00 | $ 7.50 no bid $ 10.00
Bank Run Shell| $ 10.00 | $ 7.50 798| $ 10.00 ** Award
Limerock| $ 18.80 | $ 19.00 no bid $ 19.50
SUPPLY & DELIVER PUNTA
GORDA AREA:
Shell Material| $ 13.75 | $ 19.50 2046 | $ 16.72
Shell Rock Material| $ 16.50 | $ 19.50 no bid $ 16.72
Bank Run Shell| $ 1350 | § 19.50 1551 $ 16.72
Limerock| $ 24751 $ 46.50 no bid $ 29.42
SUPPLY & DELIVER PORT
CHARLOTTE AREA:
Shell Material| $ 17.00 | $ 17.50 2530 1| $ 17.72
Shell Rock Material| $ 1950 | $ 17.50 no bid $ 17.72
Bank Run Shell| $ 17.00 | $ 17.50 20.35| % 17.72
Limerock| $ 2875| $ 36.65 no bid $ 31.42
SUPPLY & DELIVER ENGLEWOOD
AREA:
Shell Material| $ 2150 [ § 24.50 28.88 | $ 21.99
Shell Rock Material| $ 24.50 | $ 24.50 no bid $ 19.99
Bank Run Shell| $ 2135 § 2450 23931 % 21.99
Limerock| $ 3275| $ 38.50 no bid $ 33.99
FDOT Scale Certification: (Y or N) Y Y Y

Witnesses: , Kathleen M. Lindback, CPPB, Senior Contract Specialist and

Kimberly Chamberlain , Contract Specialist




